COOPER CITY
Someplace Special

MEMORANDUM

CITY MANAGER’S OFFICE

CITY OF COOPER CITY

P.0. BOX 290910

COOPER CITY, FL 33329-0910

T: 954-434-4300

F: 954-434-5099

E: coopercityhall@coopercityfl.org

TO: Mayor & Commissioners

FROM: Bruce D. Loucks, City Manager

DATE: November 22, 2016

RE: Monthly Report —~ October 2016

ADMINISTRATION:
1. Attended Davie-Cooper City Chamber Board meeting as the Cooper City Trustee.
2. Attended the I-Zone meeting for City issues and presentation of Penny Sales Tax.
3. Met with representatives from Monterra regarding development of Commercial

property.

4, Held quarterly General Employee Pension Board meeting.
5. Met with various vendors regarding opportunities in Cooper City.
6. Prepared for purchase of Postal property on Stirling Road.

BUILDING DEPARTMENT:

1.

LA

Fees Collected:

a. Bldg Services

b. General Fund
Impact Fees Collected
Permits Applied For
Permits Issued

Total Inspections Performed
Structural
Electrical

Plumbing
Mechanical
Engineer/Utility
Fire

Landscape

ocal Business Tax Receipts
Inspections
Submittal

Issued

Renewals
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$ 53,987.66

$ 1,298.00

S 4,434.00
193
154
594

326

111

70

58

16

12

10
16
116
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e. Fees Collected $29,700.69
f. Files Closed 13
g. Pages Scanned 258

7. Certificate of Occupancy 1
a. 1 (Commercial-TCO for Assisted Living)
b. 0 (Residential)

8. Certificate of Completion 1

9. Record Requests 22

10. Permits Closed:
a. BS & A 462
b. Fortis 0

11, Pages Scanned:
a. BS&A 19,777
b. Fortis 0

12, Update of Contractor Records 107

13. Lien Search 62

14. Customer Service Sign in Sheet (Excluding Zoning) 425

15, Permits Processed 171

16. Calls on permits for corrections 49

17. Mail Merge 96

18. Special Magistrate Cases 0 (Hurricane)

19. Notice of Hearing/Notice of Violation Letters 30

20. Scanning of wide format plans 1,070

21. Monthly reports for County, Property Appraiser, Growth Management, Census Bureau
and DPEP.

CITY CLERK'S OFFICE: '

1. Prepared Agendas with backup material, attended 1 Commission Meeting and
transcribed minutes for same

2. Processed election campaign reports for 2 candidates

3. Submitted 2 election ads for publication, processed 5 resolutions, 1 proclamation and
advertisements for ordinance and election purposes

4, Negotiated with Granicus to provide Closed Captioning services during Commission
workshops and meetings

5. Continued training Assistant City Clerk

6. Processed 266 passport applications, 14 garage sale permits, 4 special event permits, 28
garbage cart orders/complaints, performed 19 notary services, 13 record/copy requests

7. Prepared the docket for the Special Magistrate Hearing (10/5/2016) which was
cancelled due to Hurricane Matthew

8. The U.S. State Department conducted the annual audit of passport services and the
Clerk's Office received a perfect score once again

9. Conducted 6 interviews for the Administrative Specialist position that was vacated by
employee transfer/promotion

10. Selected a Veteran's Preference applicant who was the most qualified candidate

11. Met with representative from "Eyes On The Job" vendor to review possible benefit to
the City employees

12. Participated in the Employee Pumpkin Carving luncheon and Trick or Treat event for
children from the Recreation Department's out of school daycare

13, Participated in the Relay for Life kickoff meeting for the City's Purple Posse group
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14. Processed 2 job postings; 2 new hires; 14 employee evaluations; 79 payroll changes;
COBRA billing; created 7 employee IDs
FINANCE DEPARTMENT:
1. Prepared Invitations to Bid and Requests for Proposals for several expiring contracts
2. Participated in the effort of securing or maintaining abandoned foreclosed properties
3. Attended City Commission meetings
4, Attended General Employees Pension Board meeting
5. Received Certificate of Achievement for excellence in financial reporting for our CAFR
from GFOA
6. Met with Finance department staff to plan fiscal year 2015-16 audit
7. Started working with new auditors on preliminary field work for fiscal year 2015-16
audit
8. Configured 3 workstations for Utilities
9. Installed/configured KIP document scanning printer for Utilities
10. Installed/configured RecTrac peripherals (cameras, signature pads and barcode
scanners)
11. Began installing surge protection for network connected devices
12. Attended EOC meeting
13. Attended staff meeting regarding emergency pay procedures
14. Participated in phone conference with BS&A to discuss Fixed Assets
15. Participated in FMIT FEMA PA webinar
16. Loaded fiscal year 2016-17 budget into BS&A software system
17. Attended FPPTA Trustee school
18. Met with City Manager regarding Bids and RFP’s
19. Issued the foliowing:
a. Accounts payable checks: 361
b Payroll checks: 368
c Meter reads and Utility bills issued: 11,768
d. Purchase orders: 61
e Work orders: 278
20. Processed the following:
a. Customers at the Utility Billing window: 1,217
b. New utility accounts: 107
o Lien searches: 63
d. Utility payments: 5,130
e. Accounts Payable Invoices 548
21. Responded to 1.T. service requests: 119
GROWTH MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENT:
1 Land Development ltems
a. Commission Meeting/Workshop Items 1
b. Advisory Board Meeting Items 0
C. DRC Meeting Items 2
2. Daily Activity
a. Technical Assistance to Customers 136
b. Zoning Permit/Plan Reviews 101
C. Inspections 13
d. Zoning Letters 1
e. Alcohol License Review 1

{
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f. Records Requests 10
g Administrative Plan Revision Reviews 2
h. Special Event Permits 3
Miscellaneous Workload Indicators
a. Local Business Tax Receipt Review 14
b. Letter(s) of Flood Map Determination 1
C. Elevation Certificates 0
d. Intergovernmental Coordination Meetings 5
e. Developer/Applicant Meetings 4
Community Development Block Grant Program
a. No. of Billings 1
b. inquiries this Month (Phone/Walk-in) 3
Special Misc. Projects
a. Director and Planner attended Interdepartmental Hurricane

Preparation Meeting
b. Director and Planner attended Interdepartmental Local Business

Tax Review Meeting
c. Director and Planner attended two DRC Meetings
d. Planner reported to County EOC for Hurricane Matthew Activation
e. Director reported to Municipal EOC for Hurricane Matthew Activation
f. Director attended conference call meeting with City Manager and

City Attorney regarding potential purchase of Post Office Property
g Planner reported to County EQC for Intergovernmental Hurricane Exercise

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT:
Property Maintenance

1.

o

mpaooT

Work Orders completed 30
Street lights repaired or reported to FPL 17
Tennis court lights repaired 16
Flags replaced during monthly inspection 0
Facility signs replaced 0
Pressure cleaning square footage 1,200
Parks & Road Maintenance
Park trash removal / cleanup services 124
Athietic turf acres mowed 171
Athletic turf fertilized - 26
Athletic turf acres herbicide application 0
Athletic turf acres pesticide application 0
Soccer field lining 16
Football field lining 12
BB / SB field linings 319
BB / SB infield dragging 297
Hockey court cleanings 12
Basketball court cleanings 12
Volleyball court cleanings 5
Weekly park inspections 23
Irrigation system services 42
Miles of roadway debris cleanup 0
Potholes repaired 18

2T OFITAT T SI@0 L0 T

Lifted sidewalk grinds performed 5
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r. Trees root pruned 0
5. ROW signs reported to Broward County i5
t. Installed 9 each of new park benches and trash cans i8
u. Square footage of sidewalks replaced 9,904
V. New stop signs installed at SW 118th Avenue and SW 49th Street 4
w. Painted homecoming field for tackle football 1
X. Installed new benches and trash cans in parks 21&28
Y. Square footage of root intrusion asphalt repairs at 28 sites 840
3. Landscape / Tree Maintenance
a. Trees planted ' 0
b. Trees pruned 123
c. Trees removed 5
d. Stumps ground 4
e. Tree removal permits issued 2
f. Plan Reviews performed / meetings 1/13
g. Contractual work inspections performed 12
h. Site Visits 41
i. Work orders completed 13
j. Phone Calls 86
k. Landscape plants installed 86
L Landscape inspections/reinspections performed 1
m. Bee hives removed 0
4, Fleet Services PMs Repairs
a Heavy Equipment 5
b Vehicles 10 8
o Small Engines 3 10
d Tractor / Mowers 1 1
e. Utility Vehicles, golf carts, etc. 4 8
f. Generators Monthly Maintenance 4 3
g Trailers 0 1
5. Administration
a Recycling toters delivered 10
b Invoices verified and processed 140
o Purchase orders issued 47
c. Work orders entered 249
d Foreclosed property maintenance 12
h Gas tax reimbursement 1
i Phone calls 452
j. Programmed locks, gates, fobs 9
RECREATION DEPARTMENT:
1. Community Events
a. The Fall Community Garage Sale was held at the Sports Complex on Saturday,

October 8th. There were 60 vendors participating in the event. Approximately
1,000 patrons attended the garage sale.

b. On Friday, October 21st, the Community Book Swap took place at the Community
Center. Approximately 300 participants attended the event.
c. Trick-or-Treat Shop to Shop was held at the Embassy Lakes Shopping Center on

Saturday, October 29th. Approximately 2,000 children and parents attended the
event.
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d. Staff prepared for upcoming annual and special events to include: Veterans Day
Ceremony, Daddy Daughter Dinner, and Light Up Cooper City.

2. Recreational Programming

a. Provided 20 youth recreational classes and programs with 1,862 in attendance.

b, Provided 25 adult recreational classes and programs with 3,214 in attendance.

c. Three Kids Day Off were held at the Community Center on October 3rd, 12th and
28th.

d. Processed registrations for programs to include: Pioneer Middle School
Enrichment Program, Kids Day Off, Swim Lessons, Tot Classes, Adult Luncheon,
etc.

e. Conducted the monthly adult luncheon with a "Halloween" theme on October
28th.

3. Aguatics

a. Fall Session Swim Lesson-Session Il Registration started on October 6th.

b. Fall Session Swim Lessons-Session Il began on October 11th with 118 participants.

C. Swim for Fit Program continues for adults.

d. Staff prepared for upcoming Swim Central program for local elementary schools.

4. Rentals '
a. Four (3) rentals took place at the Pool & Tennis Center this month.
b. Twao (2) rentals took place at the Community Center this month.
5. Meetings

a. Director attended City Commission Meetings.

b Director attended Recreation Advisory Board Meeting.

C. Recreation staff attended weekly staff meetings.

d Director attended DRC meeting for review of Countryside/Flamingo Road Passive
Park.

e. Recreation staff attended Relay for Life Kick Off Meeting.

6. Other

a. The November Edition of the Kid's News was published and distributed to the
local Elementary Schools.

b. Broward County Housing Finance and Redevelopment Division conducted the
annual audit for the 41st Year CDBG grant for Senior Transportation. The County
determined that goals and scope for services were met and exceeded minimum
requirements.

C. The Recreation team activated and followed the Department's Emergency
Management Plan for preparation of Hurricane Matthew.

UTILITIES DEPARTMENT:
1. Produced 87.433 million gallons of potable water
2. Treated 78 million gallons of wastewater
3. Removed and cleaned interior screens on well no. 8 sand strainer
4, Repaired five (5) meter leaks
5. Serviced nine (9) 1” water service lines leaks
6. Replaced 150 water meters with new electronic meters
7. Cleared four (4) sewer backups
8. Repaired four (4) sewer laterals
9, Installed three (3) new cleanouts
10. Repaired three (3) fire hydrants
11. Installed no. 2 pump at lift station no. 65
12, Replaced vacuum pump at lift station no. 28
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Replaced 3,525' of water main pipes throughout the City using pipe bursting technology
Cleaned 1500' of sewer main throughout the City

Conducted weekly stormwater erosion/sediment control inspections for two (2) construction
projects

Performed underground utility inspections for three (3) projects, water, sewer, drainage,
roadway string lines/densities. Dealt with work orders: standing water in driveway/repaired
sink hole (drainage pipe hole) next to driveway.

Engineering:

a. Reviewed two (2) engineering plans

b. Issued two (2) permits
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User: kcorrea
DB: Cooper City

BALANCE SHEET FOR CITY OF COOPER CITY

Period Ending 10/31/2016

Fund 001 GENERAL FUND

GL Number Description Balance
**x Assets ***
001-000-103000-000 CASH ON HAND-IMPREST FUNDS 900.00
001-000-104800-000 EQUITY-POOLED CASH 7,500,326.57
001-000-105010~-000 TAX REC-FRANCHISE FEES & UTILITY TAXES 603,512.43
001-000-115000-000 A/R-LBTR & FIRE INSPECTIONS 33,698.21
001-000-115005-000 A/R-CITY CLERK & FINANCE 9,433.50
001-000-115020-000 A/R-DISHONORED CHECKS (NSF) 1,113.38
001-000-115030-000 A/R-EMS 1,375,421.82
001-000-115050-000 A/R~-FF (SANITATION & RECYCLING) 30,117.34
001-000-115060-000 A/R-ABANDONED PROPERTY 10,884.80
001-000-117000-000 A/R-UNCOLLECTIBLE (167,141.54)
001-000-133000-000 DUE FROM OTHER GOVERNMENT UNITS 386,440.03
001-000-135900-000  INTEREST SUSPENSE (8,761.67)
001-000-141010-000 PARTS INVENTORY 24,064.23
Total Assets 9,800,009.10
*** Liabilities ***
001-000-202000-000 ACCOUNTS PAYABLE 75,808.84
001-000-202030-000 ESCROW-RECREATION DEPARTMENT 200.00
001-000-202040~000 ESCROW-TREE TRUST 103,555.99
001-000-202041-000 ESCROW-MEMORIAIL WALKWAY 421.00
001-000-202050-000 ESCROW-TEEN COUNCIL 616.54
001-000-202051-000 ESCROW~PEACE RALLY 2,659.72
001-000-202052-000 ESCROW-PEACE BRACELETS 586.56
001-000-202063-000 ESCROW-AUTISM COMMUNITY OUTREACH 163.92
001-000-202064-000 ESCROW-CHILD PASSENGER SAFETY 4,757.53
001-000-202066-000 ESCROW-PROMOTIONAL PRODUCTS 1,310.37
001-000-202068-000 ESCROW-CERT PROGRAM 6,157.84
001-000-202069-000 ESCROW-SANTA HOLIDAY PROGRAM 4,576.72
001-000-202071-000 ESCROW-LOBBYIST 4,250.00
001-000-202072-000 ESCROW-STATION PRIDE PROJECT 7,936.48
001-000-208010-000 SALES TAX PAYABLE 219.50
001-000-220010-000 DEPOSITS~PERFORMANCE BOND 22,500.00
001-000-220024-000 DEPOSITS-ESCROW (LAND DEVELOPMENT) 4,999.54
001-000-223000-000 DEFERRED REVENUE 19,421.63
001-000~223030-000 DEFERRED REVENUE-BUILDING RENTAL DEPOSIT 3,330.00
001-000-229017-000 PAYABLE-FLEX PLAN 166.71
001-000-229026-000 PAYABLE-CANCER CARE (AMERICAN FIDELITY) (925.32)
001-000-229075-000 PAYABLE-GROUP INSURANCE (12,891.26)
001-000-229080-000 PAYABLE-PENSION 31,757.52
001-000-229085-000 PAYABLE-WORKERS COMPENSATION (14,688.57)
001-000-229550~-000 PAYABLE-COBRA INSURANCE 9,082.50
001-000-229560-000 PAYABLE-COUNTY SURCHARGE 6,392.90
001-000-229570-000 PAYABLE-BCPSF (RADON) 5,075.38
001-000~-229999-000 PAYABLE-MISCELLANEOUS 1,933.06
Total Liabilities 289,375.10
*** Fund Balance ***
001-000-244010~-000 RESERVE-INVENTORY 24,064.23
001-000-245000-000 RESERVE-ENCUMBRANCE 138,026.26
001-000-271000-000 FUND BALANCE 9,405,412.34
Total Fund Balance 9,567,502.83
Beginning Fund Balance - 15-16 9,567,502.83
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - 15-16 837,988.39
*15-16 End FB/16-17 Beg FB 10,405,491,.22
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - Current Year (894,857.22)
Ending Fund Balance 9,510,634.00
Total Liabilities And Fund Balance 9,800,009.10

* Year Not Closed
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User: kcorrea Period Ending 10/31/2016
DB: Cooper City

Fund 002 BLDG INSPECTION SERVICES

GL Number Description Balance

2/11

**% Assets *x*

002-000-103000-000 CASH ON HAND-IMPREST FUNDS 400.00
002-000-104800-000 EQUITY-POOLED CASH 274,004.60
Total Assets 274,404.60

**%* Liabilities ***

002-000-202000-000  ACCOUNTS PAYABLE 383.76

Total Liabilities 383.76

**%* Fund Balance ***

002-000-271000-000 FUND BALANCE 668,607.71
Total Fund Balance 668,607.71
Beginning Fund Balance - 15-16 668,607.71
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - 15-16 (391,677.84)
*15-16 End FB/16-17 Beg FB 276,929.87
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - Current Year (2,909.03)
Ending Fund Balance 274,020.84
Total Liabilities And Fund Balance 274,404.60

* Year Not Closed
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User: kcorrea Period Ending 10/31/2016
DB: Cooper City

Fund 103 ROAD & BRIDGE

GL Number Description Balance

*** Assets ***

- 103-000-104800-000 EQUITY-POOLED CASH 444,115.98
103-000-133000-000 DUE FROM OTHER GOVERNMENT UNITS 49,589.40
Total Assets 493,705.38

**%*% Liabilities ***

103-000-202000-000 ACCOUNTS PAYABLE 79,199.77

Total Liabilities 79,199.77

*** Fund Balance ***

103-000-245000-000 RESERVE~ENCUMBRANCE 308,573.82
103-000-271000-000 FUND BALANCE 99,057.28
Total Fund Balance 407,631.10
Beginning Fund Balance - 15-16 407,631.10
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - 15-16 63,768.81
*15-16 End FB/16~17 Beg FB 471,399.91
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures -~ Current Year (56,894.30)
Ending Fund Balance 414 ,505.61
Total Liabilities And Fund Balance 493,705.38

* Year Not Closed
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User: kcorrea Period Ending 10/31/2016
DB: Cooper City

Fund 106 POLICE CONFISCATION

GL Number Description Balance

*%* Assets ***

106-000-104800-000 EQUITY-POOLED CASH 433,768.87

Total Assets 433,768.87

**% Tjabilities ***

Total Liabilities 0.00

**% Fund Balance ***

106-000-247030-000 RESERVE-FEDERALLY CONFISCATED PROPERTY 191,693.74
106-000-271000~-000 FUND BALANCE 174,461.16
Total Fund Balance 366,154.90
Beginning Fund Balance ~ 15-16 366,154.90
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - 15-16 64,071.84
*15-16 End FB/16-17 Beg FB 430,226.74
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - Current Year 3,542.13
Ending Fund Balance 433,768.87
Total Liabilities And Fund Balance 433,768.87

* Year Not Closed
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User: kcorrea Period Ending 10/31/2016

DB: Cooper City
Fund 200 DEBT SERVICE

Page:
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GL Number Description Balance
*** Assets ***
200-000-104800-000 EQUITY-POOLED CASH 166,471.11
Total Assets 166,471.11
**% Tiabilities ***
200-000-211000-000 PAYABLE-1985A MATURED BONDS 86,462.77
200~000-212000-000 PAYABLE-1985A MATURED INTEREST 7,489.69
Total Liabilities 93,952.46
**% Fund Balance ***
200-000-271000-000 FUND BALANCE 87,645.64
Total Fund Balance 87,645.64
Beginning Fund Balance -~ 15-16 87,645.64
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - 15-16 (15,229.45)
*15-16 End FB/16-17 Beg FB 72,416.19
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - Current Year 102.46
Ending Fund Balance 72,518.65
Total Liabilities And Fund Balance 166,471.11

* Year Not Closed
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User: kcorrea Period Ending 10/31/2016
DB: Cooper City

Fund 300 CAPITAL PROJECTS

GL Number Description Balance

*** Assets *x*

300-000-101030-000 CASH IN BANK-NEW DEVELOPMENT IMPACT FEES 187,337.67
300-000-104800~000 EQUITY-POOLED CASH 4,797,281.38
Total Assets 4,984,619.05

*%% Liabilities ***

Total Liabilities 0.00

*** Fund Balance ***

300-000-245000-000 RESERVE~ENCUMBRANCE 67,861.01
300~000-247220-000 RESERVE-PUBLIC SAFETY 193,038.83
300-000-247270~000 RESERVE-PARK IMPROVEMENTS 2,095,920.21
300-000-247290-000 RESERVE-GENERAL GOVERNMENT 2,278,913.07
300-000-271000-000 FUND BALANCE 82,500.00
Total Fund Balance 4,718,233.12
Beginning Fund Balance - 15-16 4,718,233.12
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - 15-16 265,913.93
*15-16 End FB/16-17 Beg FB 4,984,147.05
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - Current Year 472.00
Ending Fund Balance 4,984,619.05
Total Liabilities And Fund Balance 4,984,619.05

* Year Not Closed
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Period Ending 10/31/2016

Fund 400 PARKING LOT

GL Number Description Balance
* % % Assets * k k

400-000-104800-000 EQUITY-POOLED CASH 72,385.57

400-000-115035-000 A/R-LEASED PARKING SPACES 30,511.99

400-000-161900-000 LAND 535,492.37

400-000-164910-000 IMPROVEMENTS-PARKING LOT 730,192.43

400-000-166930-000 EQUIPMENT-OTHER 3,702.00
400-000-167910-000 ACCUMULATED DEPRECIATION (254,407.90)

Total Assets 1,117,876.46

*%% Tiagbilities ***

400-000-202000-000 ACCOUNTS PAYABLE 926.22
400-000-208010-000 SALES TAX PAYABLE 4,313.69
400-000-220020-000 DEPOSITS~-CUSTOMER 21,200.00

Total Liabilities 26,439.91

**% Fund Balance ***

400-000-272000-000 RETAINED EARNINGS 1,036,409.76

Total Fund Balance 1,036,409.76
Beginning Fund Balance ~ 15-16 1,036,409.76
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - 15-16 (16,427.67)
*15-16 End FB/16-17 Beg FB 1,019,982.09
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - Current Year 71,454.46
Ending Fund Balance 1,091,436.55
Total Liabilities And Fund Balance 1,117,876.46

* Year Not Closed
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User: kcorrea Period Ending 10/31/2016
DB: Cooper City

Fund 440 STORM WATER

GL Number Description Balance

k%% Assets ***

440-000-104800-000 EQUITY~-POOLED CASH 522,440.73
440-000-115025-000 A/R~STORMWATER CHARGES 24,279.61
440-000-164960-000 INFRASTRUCTURE 6,789,355.97
440-000-166900-000 FURNITURE & EQUIPMENT ) 37,097.50
440-000-167910-000 ACCUMULATED DEPRECIATION (3,637,957.42)

Total Assets 3,735,216.39

**%% Tiabilities ***

440-000-202000-000 ACCOUNTS PAYABLE (0.16)
440-000-210010-000 COMPENSATED ABSENCES-CURRENT 2,860.24
440-000-210900-000 COMPENSATED ABSENCES-LONG TERM 9,057.43
440-000-229075-000 PAYABLE-GROUP INSURANCE 34,430.32
440-000-229999-000 PAYABLE-MISCELLANEOQOUS 19.91

Total Liabilities 46,367.74

**% PFund Balance ***

440-000-272000-000 RETAINED EARNINGS 3,679,768.04
Total Fund Balance 3,679,768.04
Beginning Fund Balance - 15-16 3,679,768.04
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - 15-16 (6,638.12)
*15-16 End FB/16-17 Beg FB 3,673,129.92
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures -~ Current Year 15,718.73
Ending Fund Balance 3,688,848.65
Total Liabilities And Fund Balance 3,735,216.39

* Year Not Closed
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BALANCE SHEET FOR CITY OF COQOPER CITY
Period Ending 10/31/2016

Page: 9/11

Fund 450 WATER & SEWER UTILITY FUND

GL Number Description Balance
* % Kk Assets * % %k
450-000~-101140-000 CASH IN BANK-STATE BOARD OF ADMIN 2,338.00
450-000-103000-000 CASH ON HAND-IMPREST FUNDS 900.00
450-000-104800-000 EQUITY-POOLED CASH 1,100, 364.86
450-000-115015-000 A/R-UTILITY CHARGES 1,586,476.84
450-000-117000-000 A/R~-UNCOLLECTIBLE (220,108.00)
450-000-151110-000 CERTIFICATES OF DEPOSIT 1,442,274.77
450~000-161900-000 LAND 502,816.56
450-000-164900-000 IMPROVEMENTS~OTHER THAN BUILDINGS 1,524,296.15
450-000-164920-000 TREATMENT PLANT-WATER 34,737,827.56
450-000-164930-000 TREATMENT PLANT-SEWER 26,253,703.57
450-000-166910~000 OFFICE FURNITURE & EQUIPMENT 342,259.00
450-000-166920-000 EQUIPMENT-MOTORIZED 1,602,913.10
450-000-166930-000 EQUIPMENT-OTHER 31,751.88
450-000-167910-000 ACCUMULATED DEPRECIATION (32,162,693.04)
450-000-169900-000 CONSTRUCTION IN PROGRESS 692,503.43
Total Assets 37,437,624.68
**% Tigbilities ***
450-000-202000-000 ACCOUNTS PAYABLE 101,556.65
450-000-202010-000 A/P-SOLID WASTE 233,401.80
450-000-202015-000 RECYCLE BANK 4,369.30
450-000-202020-000 A/P-RECYCLING 30,594.80
450~-000-203060-000 N/P-DEEP WELL 175,576.76
450-000-208100-000 UNCLAIMED PROPERTY-STATE OF FLORIDA (65.97)
450-000-210010-000 COMPENSATED ABSENCES-CURRENT 94,356.59
450-000-210900-000 COMPENSATED ABSENCES-LONG TERM 298,795.86
450-000-212000-000 PAYABLE-1985A MATURED INTEREST 887.66
450-000-220020~000 DEPOSITS~CUSTOMER 1,052,450.00
450-000-229075-000 PAYABLE-GROUP INSURANCE 1,012,176.19
450~000~-229999-000 PAYABLE-MISCELLANEQUS 1,299.98
Total Liabilities 3,005,399.62

*** Fund Balance ***

450-000-272000-000 RETAINED EARNINGS 38,780,934.92
Total Fund Balance 38,780,934.92
Beginning Fund Balance - 15-16 38,780,934.92
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - 15-16 (4,798,728.29)
*15-16 End FB/16-17 Beg FB 33,982,206.63
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - Current Year 450,018.43
Ending Fund Balance 34,432,225.06
Total Liabilities And Fund Balance 37,437,624.68

* Year Not Closed




11/18/2016 03:15 PM BALANCE SHEET FOR CITY OF COOPER CITY Page:

User: kcorrea Period Ending 10/31/2016
DB: Cooper City

Fund 452 RENEWAL & REPLACEMENT

GL Number Description Balance

10/11

**x% Aggets ***

452-000~104800-000 EQUITY-POOLED CASH 567,893.81

Total Assets 567,893.81

**%% Liabilities ***

452-000-202000-000 ACCOUNTS PAYABLE : 11,665.97

Total Liabilities 11,665.97

**%% Fund Balance ***

452-000-272000-000 RETAINED EARNINGS 555,564.05
Total Fund Balance 555,564.05
Beginning Fund Balance - 15-16 555,564.05
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - 15-16 24,949.76
*15-16 End FB/16-17 Beg FB 580,513.81
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - Current Year (24,285.97)
Ending Fund Balance 556,227.84
Total Liabilities And Fund Balance 567,893.81

* Year Not Closed




11/18/2016 03:15 PM

User: kcorrea
DB: Cooper City

BALANCE SHEET FOR CITY OF COOPER CITY

Period Ending 10/31/2016

Fund 453 CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT

Page:

11/11

GL Number Description Balance
* kK ASSets * % %
453-000-101140-000 CASH IN BANK-STATE BOARD OF ADMIN 6,196.18
453-000-104800-000 EQUITY-POOLED CASH 7,764,679.64
453-000-162900-000  BUILDINGS 49,225.52
453-000-164900~-000 IMPROVEMENTS-OTHER THAN BUILDINGS 640,416.93
453-000-164920-000  TREATMENT PLANT-WATER 1,105,425.33
453-000-166910-000 OFFICE FURNITURE & EQUIPMENT 1,839,476.64
453-000-167910-000 ACCUMULATED DEPRECIATION (2,085.69)
453-000-169900-000 CONSTRUCTION IN PROGRESS 4,371,803.06
Total Assets 15,775,137.61
*%% Liabilities ***
453-000-202000-000 ACCOUNTS PAYABLE 27,970.00
453-000-205010-000 RETAINAGE 184,313.74
Total Liabilities 212,283.74
*%% Fund Balance ¥***
453-000-272000-000 RETAINED EARNINGS 16,063,918.11
Total Fund Balance 16,063,918.11
Beginning Fund Balance - 15-16 16,063,918.11
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - 15-16 (473,094.24)
*15-16 End FB/16-17 Beg FB 15,590,823.87
Net of Revenues VS Expenditures - Current Year (27,970.00)
Ending Fund Balance 15,562,853.87
Total Liabilities And Fund Balance 15,775,137.61

* Year Not Closed
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INTERNAL MEMO

Date: November 6, 2016
To:  Bruce Loucks, City Manager
Cooper City

From: Capfain Robert Cates
Cooper City District

Subject: October 201 Report

During the month of October, Deputies assigned to the Cooper City District responded to 2593
calls for service. Of these calls for service, a total of 41 are Part One (Persons and Property
Crimes). The remaining 2552 calls are alarms, police service suspicious incidents, 911 hang ups,
etc.

There were a total of 11 conveyance burglaries, 4 burglaries, and 3 auto thefts. There were 19
arrests during the month in which some are documented below in the Items of Interest section of
this report.

A total of 198 code violations were addressed during the month of October. These violations are
initiated by Patrol Deputies, Parking Enforcement Personnel and Code Enforcement Inspectors.
Many of these cases and will require additional follow-up action. ‘

Also included in this report is a breakdown of the 241 State Traffic Citations and 333 Traffic
Warnings issued by District Deputies. The Accident Report by Zone lists a total of 80 accidents
investigated by District Deputies during the month of October, there were no traffic fatalities.



Items of Interest :

10.03.16 The suspect Brandon N. Khaleel was involved in a domestic dispute with his father.
During the verbal dispute the suspect armed himself with a golf club and threatened his father. The
suspect was arrested for Aggravated Assault.

On 10.06.16 Deputy Haber conducted a traffic stop on defendant Dan Delva for speeding. During
the contact with the defendant Deputy Haber could smell marijuana coming from the vehicle. After
having the defendant exit the vehicle, Deputy Haber observed marijuana all over the defendant’s
clothes and the drivers seat. Deputy Haber also located a firearm in the glove compartment.
Defendant charged with possession of marijuana and a weapons violation.

10.14.16 Michael Dinac was driving a motor vehicle with an expired tag. When approached by
Detective Rush a very strong odor of marijuana came from the vehicle. A search located marijuana
that was packaged up for sale, a grinder, a scale, and other paraphernalia used for the use and
distribution of marijuana. The suspect was arrested and charged with Possession with intent to
deliver and Possession of Paraphernalia.

10.22.16 Detective Rush was patrolling the rear of Countryside Shops when he observed Anthony
Roshuad Brown 02.16.90 looking into vehicles. Detective Rush made contact with the subject who
resides in Lauderhill, was driving a rental car with exterior tinted windows. Investigation revealed
the suspect was in possession of marijuana and had no valid driver's license. The subject also has
an extensive history for burgiary.
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EXTERNAL MEMO

Date: November 4, 2016
To: Bruce Loucks, City Manager
From: Bruce Caruso, District Chiey, ()

Subject: October 2016 Monthly Report

1) Alarm Activity
a) Total Responses 220
b) Fire/Service Related Responses 62
¢) Emergency Medical Responses 158

d) Mutual/Auto Aide Given 0
e) Mutual/Auto Aide Received 01
2) Fire Hydrant Maintenance/Flow Activity
a) Fire Hydrant Maintenance 100
,
3) Fire Marshal’s Office Activity
a) Plans Reviewed 15
b) New Const. Insp. 24
¢) Annual Fire Insp. 48
d) Annual Re-Insp. 0
e) Fire Investigations 0

f) Fire Safety Educ. Presentations 07
4) Community Programs

a) C.P.R. Program 03
b) Car Seat Program 0

I\Cooper City District\Cooper City Monthly & Annual Reports\October 2016 Cooper City Report.doc



Date Range: From 10/1/2016 To 10/31/2016
Station Selected: 28

112 - Fires in structures other than in a building

‘|-142 - Brush, or brush and grass mixture fire

! 321 - EMS call, excluding vehicle accident with injury

322 - Vehicle accident with injuries
324 - Motor vehicle accident with NO injuries
353 - Removal of victim(s) from stalled elevator
411 - Gasoline or other flammabie liguid spill
444 - Power line down
445 - Arcing, shorted electrical equipment
511 - Lock-out
531 - Smoke or odor removal

; 542 - Animal rescue

. 551 - Assist police or other governmental agency
552 - Police matter
553 - Public service
554 - Assist invalid
611 - Dispatched & cancelled en route

621 - Wrong location

622 - No incident found on arrival at dispatch address

651 - Smoke scare, odor of smoke
7156 - Local alarm system, malicious false alarm

! 735 - Alarm system sounded due to malfunction

743 - Smoke detector activation, no fire - unintentional

744 - Detector activation, no fire - unintentional

| 745 - Alarm system sounded, no fire - unintentional

C:\FireRMS55QL\reports\S_Incidents_CFAI Station incident Count Detail.rot

Thursday, November 3, 2016

2016

Page 1 of 2



Date Range: From 10/1/2016 To 10/31/2016
Station Selected: 28

2017*6 |
13
28 Total 300
'R28 106
R228 79
Q28 40
| E28 38
BC17 5
| BC55 4
HM17 4
P32 4
‘ R32 4
$32 4
E23 3
E66 3
' RE5 2
E7 1
R17 1
R68 1
S0C1 1
C:\FireRMS5SQLVeports\S,_Incidents_CFAIl Station Apparatus Count.rpt Page 1 of 1

Thursday, November 3, 2016



Mutual Aid by Type and Department

Report Date Range From: 10/1/2016 To 10/31/2016

Automatic aid received

Total s

10242 - Davie Fire Department |

08—

06 |——

' @ Automatic aid received

40/2016

C:\FireRMS5SQLvreports\S_Incidents_CFA! Station Mutual Aid.rpt . Page 1 of 1
Thursday, 3 November, 2016 ‘ g
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(] ‘WEISS SEROTA HELFMAN
& '\ COLE & BIERMAN

AT THE CROSSROADS OF BUSINESS, GOVERNMENT & THE LAW

To:  Bruce D. Loucks, City Manager A/
From: David M. Wolpin, City Attorney’s Office fl ’

Date: November 22, 2016

Re:  List of Pending Legal Work Matters as of November 22, 2016

I CODE ENFORCEMENT

Handle applicable county court prosecutions for code violations and related activities.
Provide legal services for preparation and presentation of cases before city special
magistrate; and assist in facilitating the operation of successful special magistrate
program (Jose Arango);

II. LITIGATION

1) Defend City in fire assessment case. The Circuit Court granted plaintiff’s motion
to certify a class of plaintiffs. We had filed a Notice of Appeal of that preliminary
ruling to the Fourth District Court of Appeal, as authorized by the City Manager;
and have filed the City’s Briefs. Oral argument was held at the 4" District on
November 5, 2013. By Per Curiam decision of November 14, 2013, the 4%
District (without a written opinion) affirmed the Circuit Court’s certification of a
class of plaintiffs to allow the case to proceed as a class action, Since the appellate
court decision returned the case to the Trial Court, the previous stay or hold on
trial court proceedings is removed , and the defense of the case will proceed at
the Trial Court level pursuant to the several defenses asserted in the City’s
previously filed Answer and Affirmative Defenses, On June 2, 2014, the Trial
Court issued an Agreed Order requiring the Plaintiffs to publish and mail a notice
of the pending class action litigation, as required by the rules governing class
actions, so that persons who are alleged to be part of the class may know of the
class action and may decide whether to remain in or exclude themselves from the
class action as the case proceeds. Plaintiffs mailed and published a notice, and
have recently repeating the notice process because of a defect in the return
mailing address that they used in the first attempted notice. The discovery process
in on-going. Plaintiffs filed a motion for partial summary judgment. Plaintiffs

1

200 E. Broward Blvd., Suite 1900, Ft. Lauderdale, FL 33301 | 954-763-4242 [ www.wsh-law.com



subsequently filed an amended motion for partial summary judgment. We have
examined that amended motion, and have responded to it. A hearing was held on
the motion for partial summary judgment on July 7, 2015. The Court took the
matter under advisement upon the conclusion of that hearing. On July 20, 2015,
the Court determined that Plaintiff’s challenge to the 2006 fiscal year fire
assessments is barred by the statute of limitations. Subsequently, by Order of
September 10, 2015, the Court ruled in the City’s favor on the Plaintiffs’ motion
for partial summary judgment by denying that motion. On October 28, 2015,
Plaintiffs filed anothet Motion for Summary Judgment. On November 4, 2015,
the City filed its Motion for Summary Judgment. A case status conference was
held by the Court on December 16, 2015. The Circuit Court held a hearing on the
respective motions for summary judgment on February 15, 2016. At the
conclusion of the hearing, the Court took the matter under advisement and
announced that it would rule in the future. Subsequently, the Court issued an
Order dated April 14. 2016, a copy of which was obtained on April 18, 2016, in
which the Court denied the City’s Motion for Summary Judgment, and granted, in
part, the Plaintiff’s Motion for Summary Judgment concerning some of the City’s
affirmative defenses, including the City’s affirmative (and well founded) defense
that Plaintifs suit is prohibited as not timely filed within the 20 day jurisdictional
standard of the Fire Assessment enabling Ordinance and Resolutions. The trial
of the case may be held sometime during the Court’s June 13- July.1, 2016 trial
period. A standard court ordered mediation was held as previously scheduled on
April 19, 2016, and a further court- ordered mediation may be held before the
trial. The Court held a pre- trial conference on June 16, 2016, and expressed an
intent to have found that the fire assessment was not properly apportioned
between residential and other assessed properties. The Court may issue a
clarifying Order on that aspect of its prior Summary Judgment Order. On June 20,
2016, the Plaintiffs indicated that they will seek to dismiss Count I concerning
their allegations that the special assessments funded EMS. In light of these
developments, a trial is not anticipated at this time. On June 21, 2016, the
Plaintiffs, for the first time, presented a settlement proposal for City
consideration. On July 5, 2016, the Court issued a Final Judgment reflecting that
the Plaintiffs dismissed Count I (which had alleged that funds from the special
assessment were used for EMS) and declaring that the apportionment was
improper as to Count II. As requested by the City Manager, the City filed its
appeal to the Fourth District Court of Appeal on July 19, 2016. Plaintiffs recently
belatedly filed a motion in the trial court seeking to have that court declare that
the plaintiffs are entitled to a fire assessment refund in an unspecified amount.
However, since the case is presently pending on appeal to the Fourth District
Court of Appeal, the trial court does not have jurisdiction to consider that motion.
The City’s appellate brief was filed at the end of October, 2016 ( Matt Mandel,
Jamie Cole , Ed Guedes);

2
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2)

Assist City staff in coordination and monitoring of liability claims and cases
handled by FMIT insurance counsel (David Wolpin).

OTHER MATTERS

1)

2

3)

4

5)

6)

7)

8)
)

Handle labor issues and provide labor related advice for Human Resources
(Alison Smith, Milton Collins, Brett Schneider);

Represent City as a party plaintiff in asset distribution litigation against Broward
County and in related dispute resolution and mediation proceedings, concerning
Resource Recovery Board / Solid Waste system, as authorized by City
Commission. An attorney- client session to discuss a potential settlement offer
was previously held. Settlement approval has been processed by the largest
municipalities, and has also been approved by the Broward County Commission.
The Settlement was approved at the City Commission meeting of April 28, 2015,

“and has been approved by all of the other participating cities. Distribution of

settlement proceeds to the cities has been made. We are monitoring the County’s
compliance with the remaining requirements of the seitlement and the
consideration and approval of amendments, and attending applicable municipal-
county meetings (Jamie Cole, Anthony Soroka);

Advise on implementation of County ethics ordinances, as amended, and provide
advisory opinions, assistance and advice on public service ethics when requested
(David Wolpin, Robert Meyers);

As requested by City Manager, assist staff with collection of delinquent utility
bills including late fees (Aleida Molina, David Wolpin);

Assist Growth Management department on land use matters ( Kathy Mahaffey);

\

Assist Public Works department on countryside lake maintenance responsibility
matter ( Kathy Mahaffey, Gail Serota );

Assist City Manager and Growth Management Director on potential USPS land
acquisition by City, including purchase contract, and loan ( Lily Arango, Jeff
DeCarlo, David Wolpin) ;

Assist City Manager on road maintenance matter( David Wolpin) ;

Draft Ordinance for additional senior citizen homestead exemption, as directed by
City Commission, for final consideration and adoption at November 22, 2016
Commission meeting (David Wolpin) ; and

3
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10) Examine Agenda Items for November 22, 2016, City Commission meeting
(David Wolpin).

4
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WEISS SEROTA HELFMAN
COLE & BIERMAN, P.L.

2525 Ponce de Leon Boulevard
Suite 700 s
Coral Gables, Florida 33134 "
305-854-0800 . %, .
Fax 305-854-2323 °
Tax ID No. 20-8 112403

Cooper City
9090 S.W. 50th Place
Cooper City, FL 33329

October 27, 2016
Reference No. 184302

CLIENT: 1573 - Cooper City

Matter Services  Expenses Total
001 - General Representation 9,198:23 26847 9,466.70
003 - Ordinance Enforcement 5,670.04 0.00 5,670.04
003-1 - Special Magistrate Cases 0.00 26.83 26.83
004 - Planning and Zoning 46.11 0.00 46.11
005 - Public Works and Utilities 5,117.95 0.00 5,117.95
006 - Real Estate and Transactions 3,273.58 0.00 3,273.58
009 - Foreclosures | 299.70 0.00 299.70
011 --Communications And Related Work 645.51 0.00 645.51
022 - Joliff, Walter, Barbara - Class Action Challenge  6,985,36 639.22 7,624.58
to Fire. Rescue Fees

023 - Ethics Compliance Advice And Advisory 806.88 0.00 806.88
Opiniens '

024 - Charter Review Board 46.11 0.00 46.11

Due This Bill "~ $33,023.99



Client Ref:

Re:
Date
09/02/16
09/06/16
09/07H6
09/07/16

09/07/16
09/07/16
09/08/16
09/08/16
09/09/16
09/09/16
09/09/16
09/12/16
09/12/16

09/12/16

Qo216

09/12/16
09/12/16
09/12/16
09/13/16

09/13/16
09/13/16

09/13/16

1573:- Cooper City
Reference No. 184302

001 General Representation

dmw
dmw
acs

ecg

dmw

dmw

acs
dmw
ecg
drmw
dmw
ecg

ecg

ecg

ecg

dmw.
dmw
dmw

‘ecg

ecg

ecg

amw

Services

Examine Agenda; Follow-Up

Examine Agenda ltem; Follow-Up

Review First Budget Hearing Agenda Item And DOR
Forms; Conduct Related Research

Research Re Whether The City May Make
Epinephrine Auto-Injectors Available For Use At City
Parks, Such As Sports Complex, Peol And Tennis
Center, And Community Center, By City Personnel
And If So, Whether There Is Any Statutory Protection
Of The City From Tort Liability )

Examine Commission Agenda ltems; Follow-Up
Examine Correspondence And Advise Parks &
Recreation Director On Epi Pen Matter

Follow Up On Millage And Budget Agenda ltems
Examine Commission Agenda ltems; Follow-Up-
Research Whether City Is Required To Pay Music
Licensing Fees

Follow-Up-On Music Licensing Matter

Examine Commission Agenda Items; Follow-Up
Continued Research Re Whether City Is'Required To
Pay Music Licensing Fees A

ReviewAnd Analyze Letter From Ms. Mach On
Behalf Of Cypress Property And Casualty Insurance
Company Re Its Claim That It:Has No Liability For
Business Occupational Tax [n The City

Gather Background Information Concerning Cypress-
Property-And Casualty Insurance Company's Claim
That It Has No Liability For Business Occupational
TaxInTheCity

Research Re Whether An Insurance Company Which
Is Located Outside The Municipality Is Required To
Pay-Business Occupational Tax Imposed By The City
Follow-Up On Music Licensing Matter

Prepare For Commission Meeting

Examine LBTR, Insurance Company Matter

Receipt And Review Of Coirespondence From Ms.

Garcia Re The City's Agreement With-BMI For Music
Licensing

Continued Research Re Whether City s Required To
Pay Music Licensing Fees In Light Of Information
Received From Ms. Garcia

Draft Correspondence To Ms. Garcia In Response To
Her Correspondence Re BMI Agreement For Music
Licensing

Follow-Up On Music Licensing Matter

October 27, 2016

Page 1

Hours Amount
0.30 69.16
- 0.20 46.10
0.50 115.27
0.90 207.49
1,40 322.75
'0.-50 115.27
0.20 46.10
0.90 207-48
0.30 69.16
0.20 46.10
0.90 207.48
0.80 184.43
0.70 161.37
0.30 69.16
1.20 276.65
0.20 46.10
1.40 322.75
0.20 4610
0.30 69.16
0.30. 69.16
0.30 69.16
0.20: 46.10



Client Ref: . 1573 - Cooper City October 27, 2016

Reference No. 184302 Page 2
Date Services Hours Amount
09/13/16 dmw Research And Draft Additional Senior Citizen 1.50 345.81

Homestead Exemption Ordinance As Directed By
City Commission

09/13/16 dmw  Examine LBTR, Insurance Company Matter 0.20 46.10
09/14/16 dmw  Research And Revise Draft Of Additional Senior 1.40 322.75
. Citizen Homestead Exemption Ordinance

09/14/16 dmw  Examine LBTR, Insurance Company Matter 0.20 46.10

09/14/16 dmw Examine Commission Agenda 0:20 46.10

09/15/16 dmw  Revise Draft Of Additional Senior citizen Homestead  0.40 92.21

o Exemption Ordinance _
09/15/16 dmw Examine Commission Agenda Items; Follow Up 0.90 207.48
09/16/16 ecg Research Re Whether State Division Of Blind 0.30 69.16
v Services Must Be Involved In Vending Agreement

09/16/16 K Review And Analyze Agreement With Fresh And 0.60- 138.32
Healthy Vending; Conduct Related Research

09/16/16. dmw  Research And Revise.Draft Of Additional Senior 0.70 161.37

_ Citizen Homestead Exemption Ordinance

09/16/16 dmw  Examine Commission Agenda ltems: Follow-Up. 0.50 115.27

09/16/16° dmw  Follow-Up On Propeity Damage Claim Release 0.20 46.10
Matter

09/16/16 eph Review And Evaluate Property Damage Claim Re 0.80 184.43
Elm Enterprises - Edward Marx Damage To City
Property ,

09/19/16 ki Prepare Correspondence To Ms. Garcia Related To 1.40 322.75
Fresh And Healthy Vending; Analyze Related Issiies _

09/19/16 dmw  Examine School Bus Use Agreement; Follow-Up 0.50 115.27

09/19/16 dmw  Revise And Finalize Draft Of Additional Senior Citizen  0.70 161.37
Homestead Exemption Ordinance For Agenda v

09/19/16 dmw  Examine Commission Agenda Items; Follow-Up 0:30 69.16

09/20/16 dw  Update Work-Status Memo 0:20 46,10

09/20/16 dmw  Prepare For Final Budget Hearing Of Commission 1.00 230.54

09/21/16 ecg Review Correspondence From Cypress Property 0.20 46.10

And Casualty Insurance Company Re Its Denial Of
Liability For The City's Business License Tax.In
o Preparation Of Drafting Reply
09/21/16 ecg Draft-Reply To Cypress Property And ‘Casualty 0.30 69.16
- Insurance Company's Letter Of Denial Of Liability For
o The City's Business License Tax :
09/21/16 ecg Continue Drafting Reply To Cypress Property And 0.50 115.27
Casualty Insurance Company's Letter Of Denial Of
N Liability For The City's Business License Tax
09/21/16 ecg Gather Background Information Concerning Cypress  0.20 46.11
Property And Casualty Insurance Company's Letter
Of Denial Of Liability For The City's. Business License
. Tax In Preparation Of Drafting Reply
09/21/16 dmw Examine LBTR Matter Concerning Insurance 0.30 69.16
Company



Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City ‘ October 27, 2016

Reference No. 184302 Page 3

Date Services Hours Amount

09/21/16 ki Review Correspondence From Ms. Garcia Regarding  0.20 46.10
- Agreement With Fresh And Healthy Vending

09/22/16 acs Research Concerning License Plate Camera 1.40 32276
Readers And Fourth Amendment Case Law

09/22/16 ecg ReviewAnd Analyze Florida L eague Of Cities’ 0.30 69.16

Response To Cypress Property And Casualty
insurance Company's Letter Of Denial Of Liability For
S The City's Business License Tax ‘ -
09/22/16 ecg Draft Reply To Cypress Property And Casualty 0.30 69.16
Insurance Company's Letter Of Denial Of Liability For
The City's Business. License Tax In-Accordance With
The Florida League Of Cities' Reply

09/22/16 dmw  Examine LBTR Matter Concerning Insurance 0.30 69.16
Company; Finalize Letter To Insurance Cormpany
‘ _ Including FLC Letter ‘
- 09/22/16 dmw  Examine Draft Of Minutes As Requested By City 0.20 46.10
Clerk -
09/23/16 dmw  Examine.Commission Agenda; Follow-Up 0.40 92.21
09/26/16° dmw  Examine CommissionAgenda ; Follow-Up 0.40 92.21
09/26/16 jmn Review And Analysis Of City Contract With BSO And  1.00 . 230.54

Investigative File/Police Reports On Arrest Re
Assessment Of Forfeiture. And Portion Due To City

09/27/16 ki Review: Cor_respondence From Ms. Garcia Related 0.20 46.10
To Agreement For Vending Machine Services With -
Right Choice Vending
09/27/16 dmw  Examine Commission Agenda ltems; Follow-Up 0.90 207.48
09/27/16 dmw  Examine Recreation Board Matter 0.70 161.37
09/27/16 dmw  Examine Accounting RFP Matter 0.30 69.16
09/28/16 jrn Receipt And Review Of Correspondences 0.20 46.11

Concerning Asset Forfeiture Interpretation-Of
Contract And Statute In Case# 16-1407-000939
09/28/16 ecg Receipt And Review Of Correspondence From Ms. 0.20 46.10
Poling With Attached Letter From Tokio Marina
American Insurance Company

09/28/16 -ecg Draft Response Letter From Tokio:Marina American 0.30 69.16
» Insurance Company
09/28/16 K Review And Revise Contract For Vending Machine 1.50 345.81

Services: With Right Choice- Vendmg, Conduct
Related Research

09/28/16 dmw  Examine BSO Asset Sharing Matter 0.20 46.10

09/28/16 dmw  Examine: Commission Agenda ltems; Follow-Up 0.70 161.37

09/28/16 dmw  Examine And Confer On Accounting RFP Matter 0.40 92.21

09/28/16 dmw.  Examine And Confer On Vending Machine 0.30 69.16
Agreement For Parks & Recreation Department

09/28/16 dmw  Examine ADA Matter 0.20 46.10

09/28/16 ram Research Concerning ADA Request For 0.50 1156.27

Accomodations



Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City
Reference No. 184302

Date
09/28/16 acs

09/29/16 mr¢
09/29/16 ‘mrc
09/29/16  dmw
09/29/16 dmw
09/29/16 ram
09/30/16 ram

Total for Services

Services

Review And Attend To Inquiry Regarding Use-Of
Surtax Funds For Land Acquisition

Review And Analyze Federal Regulations Re
Reasonable Accommodation For Deaf Individual
Telephone Conference With Department Of Justice
Re Closed Captioning As: Reasonable
Accommodation

Confer And Follow Up On ADA Matter

Examine Commission Agenda Items: Foliow Up

‘Conference Concerning ADA Request For

Accomodations
Conference Concerning ADA Request For
Accomodations

For Disbursements Incurred

Date Description

PACER-Public Access t

-Pages)

Postage thru 09/30/16
Westlaw Research thru 09/30/16:

Total Expenses

Total This Matter

October 27, 2016

Hours

0.30

1.50
0:40

0.20
0.30

0.20
0.20

o Court Electronic Records thru 09/30/16 (0

Page 4
Amount
69.16
345.81
92.21
46,10
69.16
46.10
46.10

$9,198.23

Amount
15.30

7.34
245.83

$268.47

$9,466.70



Client Ref:  1573.- Cooper City- October 27, 2016

Reference No. 184302 Page 5

Re: 003 Ordinance Enforcement

Date Services Hours Amount

09/01/16 dmw  Examine.And Confer On Sign Matter 0.30 69.16

09/01/16 jla. Receipt And Review Of Correspondences Regarding  0.50 115.27
’ Compliance With Sign Regulations

09/01/16 lad Review Parcel Information And Plats Regarding 1.90 438.03

Dedication Of Parcels For Public And/Or Right Of
Way Purposes (Sign Approval Request For Election
Signs) (Parcel Id's 1406080010; 504131200850;
504413200720; And 514106080020);Conference On

Same
09/02/16 kmm  Research Code And Analyze Donation Bin Issues 0:40 92.22
09/02/16 jla Prepare For And Attend Conference With Ihspector 0.70 161.37
To Review Cases Set For Special Magistrate Hearing _
09/02/16 dmw  Examine And Confer On Sign Matter; Follow-Up 0:30 69.16
09/02/16 dmw  Examine Matter Of Clothes Donation Bin 0.40 92.21
09/02/16 lad ‘Examine And Confer On Location Of Proposed 0.80 184.43

Election Signs On Right Of Way For Parcel Id No.
514106080020; Correspondence Regardlng Same
(City Municipal Facility)

09/06/16 jla Prepare For And Attend Telephonic Pre-hearing With ~ 0.70 161.38
Inspectors To Prepare For Special Magistrate
Hearing
09/06/16 dmw  Examine Matter Of Clothes Donation Bin; Follow-Up ~ 0.20 46.10
09/07/16. jla Prepare For And Attend Special Magistrate Hearing 3.00 691.62
09/07/16 jla ‘Follow Up On Items. From Meeting Relating To 060 138.32
‘ ‘Special Magistrate Hearing
09/12/16 -dmw  Examine Bee:Nuisance Matter 0.30 69.16
09/13/16 jla Review And Reply To Correspondence Re Florida 0.30 69.16

Case.Law On Legal Remedies Against Residential
Bee Keepers

09/13/16 jla Research Concerning Florida Statutes And Case Law  1.90 438.03
On Legal Remedies To Enforce Residential Bee
_ _ Keepers . :
09/13/16 dmw  Examine Bee Nuisance Matter 0.20 46.10
09/14/16 jla ‘Review And-Analyze Subpoenas For Next Special 0.70 161.37
' Magistrate Hearing v _
09/14/16. dmw  Examine Bee Nuisance Matter 0.20 46.10
09/15/16 jla Receipt And Review Of Correspondences Regarding  0.40 9222
Subpoenas Issued To Officers For Special Magistrate
v v Hearing
00/15/16 dmw  Examine Bee Nuisance Matter 0.20 48.10
09/15/16 lad Review Property Information, Plat and Title' Re 1.00 $230.54

Election Signs Located Adjacent to Sunoco Site

(12200 Griffin Road) ,
09/16/16 dmw  Examine Bee Nuisance Matter 0.20 46.10
09/16/16. dmw  Examine Sign Matter 0.30 69.16



Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City October 27, 2016

Reference No. 184302 Page 6

Date- Services Hours. Amount

09/16/16 ‘lad Confer on location of Election Signs and Title for 0.60 138.32
o Parcel Adjacent to Sunoco Site (12200 Griffin Road)

09/19/16  lid Confer Re Obtain Deed From FDOT on Griffin Road 0.60 45.00

Parcel Subject To R/W; Review Pertinent Property

Information From Property Appraisers Site And

Correspondence Thereto. Re Sign On Subject

Property; Ran Preliminary Search On Broward Public

Records And Did Not Find Requested Deed;

Correspondence To And With Title Agent (Old

Republic) Requesting Title/Deed Search _ -
09/19/16 dmw  Examine And Advise On Sign Matter 0.30 69.16
09/19/16. lad Review Colinty Recorder's Search Regarding Locate  0.50 115.27

Deed To FDOT For Parcel Adjacent To Griffin Road

(Sunoco Site; Election Slgns) Conference On Title

Order
09/20/16 dmw.  Examine Griffin Road Slgn Matter 0.20 46.10
09/21/16 acs Analyze Any Fourth Amendment Issues Regarding 0.70 161.37
‘ License Plate Readers; Conduct Related Research _ N
09/21/16 acs Analyze Fourth Amendment And Privacy Issues 0.50 116.27
‘ Concerning Proposed License Plate Readers
09/22/16 ecg Research Whether Special Law Enforcement Trust 0.40 92.21

Funds May Be Expended For Police Personnel Costs
Of A New Pilot Program

09/22/16 dmw  Examine 90th Avenue School Traffic Nuisance Matter  0.20 46.10
09/23/16 jla Review And Analyze Agenda Of Cases Set For 0.50 115.27
o o Specnal Magistrate Hearing
09/23/16 dmw  Examine 90th Avenue School Traffic Nuisance Matter  0.30 69.16
09/26/16 jla Conference Concerning Preparation Of Subpoenas 0.40 92.21
L _For Next Special Magistrate Hearing
09/27/16 jla ReceiptAnd Review Of Correspondence Regarding 0.30 69.16
Appeal Of Special Magistrate Order )
09/28/16. jla Telephone Conference With Jeffrey Sandler 0.40 92.22

Regarding Settlement Of Outstanding Code
Enforcement Fine

09/28/16 jla Conference Concerning Course Of Action Regarding  0.40- 92.21
N Settlement Of Outstanding Code Enforcement Fine
09/28/16 jla Review And.Respond To Corréspondence From 0.80 184.43

Jeffrey Sandler Regarding Possible Appeal Of
Outstanding Code Enforcement Fine Or Settlement

o Of Same
09/28/16 dmw  Foliow-Up On Special Magistrate Mitigation Order 0.20 46.10
Matter
09/29/116  jla Draft Agreed Order On Settlement Of Code 0.50 115.27

Enforcement Case



Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City

Reference No. 184302

Date
09/29/16 jla

09/30/16 jla
09/30/16 jla

Total for Services:

Services Hours
Conference Concerning Course:Of Action Regarding  0.60
Settlement Of Code Enforcement Fines

Prepare For And Attend Prehearing With Officer 0.70
Reale To Prepare For Special Magistrate Hearing

Review Agenda-Of Cases Set For Special Magistrate  0.40
Hearing

Total This Matter

October 27, 2016

Page 7

Amount
138.32

161.37
92:21

$5,670.04

T $5,670.04



Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City
Reference No. 184302

Re: 003-1 Special Magistrate Cases
For Disbursements Incurred

Date Description
Westlaw Research thru 09/30/16
Total Expenses

Total This Matter

October 27, 2016

Page 8

Amount
26.83
$26.83

$26.83



ClientRef: 1573 - Cooper City
Reference No. 184302

Re: 004 Planning and Zoning

Date Services »

09/23/16 kmm  Address Site Plan And Conditional Use Required
Conditions

Total for Services

Total This Matter

October 27, 2016
Page 9

Hours. Amount

$46.11

$46.11



Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City October 27, 2016

Reference No. 184302 Page 10
Re: 005 Public Works and Utilities

Date Services Hours Amount
09/01/16 acs Follow Up With Pembroke Pines Counsel Regarding  0.40 92.21

Sheridan Street Hedge Annexation Matter; Analyze
Potential Timeline For Deannexation Process

09/06/16 tim Review And Evaluate Correspondence Re. 1.00 230.54
SCADA-DB Task Orders | o
00/08/16 acs  Telephone Conference With Pembroke Pines: 0.20 46.10
Counsel Regarding Status Of Sheridan Street Hedge
o Matter L
09/09/16 tim Review And Evaluate Correspondence from City Re 1.70 391.92
Contract Language For SCADA-DB Task Orders
09/12/16 tm  ReceiptAnd Review Of Desired EJCDC Provisions 1,70 391.92
_ _ For SCADA-Build Task Orders ‘
09/14/16 dmw  Follow Up-On Parking Lot Surveillance Matter 0.20 46.10
09/14/16 tim Research And Review Of Statutes Re Design-Build 1.00 230.54
o And Continuing Contracts ,
09/16/16 acs. Review Correspondence From Attorney Tolces 0.20 46.10
Regarding Update:On Sheridan Street Hedge Matter _ o
09/16/16- acs Review Correspondenice From County Attorney's 0.20 46.10

Office:Regarding Status Of Consent to Sheridan
Street Hedge Annexation

09/22/16- tim Continued Preparation Of Revised Task Order 1.90 438.03
2016-02 For SCADA System Design-Build Project

09/26/16. tim Continued Preparation Of Revised Task Order 4.40 1,014.38
2016-02 For SCADA System Desigh-Build Project

09/27/16 tim Review And Evaluate Correspondence Re Revision 2.00 461.08

Of Task Order 2016-02 For SCADA System
Design-Build Project

09/28/16 dmw  Examine Pool Center Project Matter ‘ 0.20 46.10
09/29/16 acs Telephone Conference With Attorney Tolces 0.20 46.10
Regarding Status Of Sheridan Street Hedge Matter _ ,
09/29/16 tim Continued Preparation Of Revised Task Order 2106 3.00 691.62
} For SCADA System Design-Build Project
09/30/16  tim Finalize And Submit For Review Revised Task Order  3.90 899.11
2016-02 For SCADA System Design-Build Project
Total for Services $5,117.95
Total This Matter $5,117.95

e e



Client Ref; 1573 - Cooper City October 27, 2016

Reference No. 184302 Page 11
Re: 006 Real Estate and Transactions
Date Services Hours Amount
09/01/16 dmw  Examine, ConferAnd Follow-Up USPS Land 0.40 92.21
‘ Purchase Matter
09/02/16 dmw  Examine, Confer And Follow-Up USPS Land. 0.50 11527
Purchase Matter
09/06/16 dmw  Examine, Confer And Follow-Up USPS Land 0.40 92.21
Purchase Matter; Telephone Conference With Mr.
Chris Wood v _
09/07/16 dmw  Examine, ConferAnd Follow-Up.USPS Land 0.30: 69.16
v Purchase Matter
09/08/16. dmw  Examine, Confer And Fallow-Up USPS Land 0.40 92.21
Purchase Matter ,
09/08/16 lad Telephone Conference With With Mr. Wood (CBRE) 0.50 115.27

Regarding Submittal Of Offers For Stirling Road
Parcel And Requirements Therefore; Conference On

Same
09/09/16 dmw  Examine, ConferAnd Foliow-Up USPS Land 0.50 115:27
Purchase Matter -

09/12/16. dmw  Examine, Confer And Follow-Up USPS Land 0.30 69.16
_ Purchase Matter :
09/13/16 dmw  Examine, Confer And Follow-Up.USPS Land 0.30 69.16

Purchase Letter Of Intent ,
09/13/16 lad Prepare Letter Of Intent To CBRE Regarding 2.80 645.51
Acquisition Of Stirling Road Land From USPS »
09/14/16 dmw  Examine, Confer And Follow Up On USPS Land 0.70 161.37
‘ , Purchase Final Letter Of Intent , o
09/14/16 lad Revise And Finalize Letter Of Intent For Purchase Of  1.50 -345.81
Stirling Road Land; Conference On Terms Of
, Purchase ‘ o
09/15/16 dmw  Follow Up On USPS Land Purchase Final Letter Of 0.20 46,10
Intent
09/16/16. dmw  Follow-Up On USPS Land Purchase 0.20 46.10
09/22/16 dmw  Examine Status Of USPS Land Sale 0.20 46.10
09/23/116 dmw Examine Process For USPS Land Sale 0.30 69.16
09/26/16 dmw  Examine Process for USPS Land Sale _ 0.30 69.16
09/27/16 lad Review and Address Correspondence from Mr Wood  0.50 115.27

and Preliminary Review of Contract with USPS
(Stirling Road Land)

09/28/16 dmw  ExamineAnd Follow-Up On USPS Land Purchase 0.70 161.37
Matter
09/28/16. lad Review and Revise form of Contract For Sale and 1.30 299,70

Purchase Provided by USPS (Stirling Road Land)
‘ Confer on Same
09/29/16 dmw  Examine, Confer And Follow Up On USPS Land 0.70 161.37
Purchase Matter



Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City
Reference No. 184302

Date Services

09/29/16  lad Review And Address Terms Of Contract Submitted
By USPS And Due Diligence To Be Ordered:;
Correspondence With Mr. Wood Re Same
09/30/16 dmw . Follow-Up USPS Land Purchase Matter

Total for Services

Total This Matter

October 27, 2016
Page 12

Hours Amount
1.00 230.54

0.20 46.10
$3,273.58

$3,273.58

ey



Client Ref: 1573 - CSoper City
Reference No. 184302

Re: 009 Foreclosures

Date Services

09/20/16 amm  Receive And Review Fields Law Supplement For
Relevance To City o

09/21/16 amm  Receive'And Review Pleadings Regarding Striking
Affirmative Defenses, Follow Up

09/28/16 amm  Attention To Kunes Judgment, Attention To Current
Market Value For Cooper City Continued Interest In
Foreclosure, Follow Up Regarding Same

Total for Services

Total This Matter

October 27, 2016

Hours
0.30

0.20

0.80

Page 13

Amount
69.16

46.11
184.43

$299.70

$299.70

e



Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City
Reference No. 184302

Re: 011 Communications And Related Work

Date Services

09/01/16 alg Examine Matter; Draft:Response Opinion To Mr.
Wood Regarding FPL/T-Mobile Telecom; Telephone
Call With Mr. Wood Regarding Same

09/01/16 dmw  Examine And Confer On T-Mobile/FPL Cell Tower
Conditional Use Matter

09/02/16 dmw Examine And Confer On T-Mobileé/FPL Cell Tower
Conditional Use Matter

Total for Services

Total This Matter

October 27, 2016

Hours
2.20

0.40
0.20

Page 14

Amount
507.19

92,22
46:10

$645.51

$645.51



Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City October 27, 2016

Reference No. 184302 Page 15

Re: 022 Joliff, Walter, Barbara - Class Action Challenge to Fire Rescue Fees

Da_te | Services. Hours Amount

09/02/16 egg Review Motion For Supplemental Relief. Confer Re 0.30 69.16
Same _ .

09/02/16 jac Analyze Motion For Supplemental Relief And Develop 0.50 115.27
Strategy Re Response o

09/02/16 mhm  ReviewAnd Analyze Motion For Supplemental Relief  0.50 115.27

09/06/16  tcj Consider Strategy Regarding Jurisdiction Of Trial 0.20 46.10
Court To Entertain Motions Related To Declaratory \
v Judgment After Notice Of Appeal _ o
09/06/16 tcj Research Concerning. Jurisdiction Of Trial Court To 1.90 438.03
Hear Motion For Supplemental Relief After Notice Of
Appeal Of Declaratory Judgment

09/06/16 tcj Review And Analyze Case Law Re Supplementary 1.00 230.54
| Proceedings |
09/08/16. egg Begin Review Of Record; Key Pleadings And 2.40 553.30
Motions; in Preparation Of Initial Brief o
09/09/16 egg Continued Review And Analysis Of Record And Key 3.80 876.05
o Cases Relied Upon By Parties In Dispositive Motions -
09/12/16  aas Review And Evaluate Motions For Summary 1.50 345.81
Judgment And Court's Order To Identify Issues For
Appeal o
09/13/16 aas Review All Motions For Summary:Judgment, 4.40 1,014.38

Responses And Replies, Hearing Transcripts, And
Order Below, And Organize Issues For Appeal, With
Key Cases And Arguments, And Confer

09/13/16 egg.  Conference Concerning Strategy For Initial Brief And  0.50 115.27
o Potential Arguments

09/13/16 egg Preparation Of Correspondence To-Opposing 0.20 46.11

_ Counsel Re Extension Of Time For Initial Brief o

09/13/16 mhm  Develop Strategy Concerning Appeal And Analyze. 1.10 253.59
Issues Re Same o _

. 09/13/16 egg Preparation Of Notice Of Agreed Extension To- Serve  0.40 92.22

Initial Brief

09/14/16 .aas Review And Analyze Cases Regarding Statute Of 2,70 622.46
Limitations, With Conclusions Regarding Same

09/15/16 egg Review And Analyze Case Law Re Definition Of 0.70 161.38

Special Law To Ascertain Whether Ordinance Would
Be Encompassed By Definition o
09/15/16 .aas Review Motions For Summary Judgment Again To 1.00 230.54
Isolate Key Arguments And Organize All Cases
Cited; Review Cases Cited In Motion Practice,
Annotate, And Determine Which Cases May Be Used
In Initial Brief



Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City October 27, 2016

Reference No. 184302 Page 16
Date Services Hours Amount
09/20/16 -aas Review And Evaluate Transcript Of Summary 1.90 438.03

Judgment Hearing And Develop Additional Research
Topics And Organize Issues-For-Initial Brief, Develop
Strategy Regarding Appeal Of Ruling Re Count 1t Of
o Complaint
09/20/16 egg Conference Concerning Strategy For Drafting Initial 0.50 115.27
' Brief Re Validity Of Methodology For Apportionment ~
- Of Special Assessment
09/27/16 aas Follow Up With Clerk Of Court Re Obtaining Record 0.20 46.10
o OnAppeal i
09/30/16  egg Conference Concerning Status. Of Initial Brief 0.20 46.10
Preparation » , N
09/30/16 aas Review And Evaluate City Ordinances, Resolutions, 4.40 1,014.38
Burton And Associates Fire Study, Affidavits, And
Develop Approach For Appeal
Total for Services $6,985.36

For Disbursements Incurred

Date _D,escrip_'tionv _ Amount
09/01/16 Court Reporter/Deposition/Transcripts Certified Copy- Of Transcript Of: 184.00
James Curran - Bailey & Associates Reporting, Inc. v
09/12/16:  Filing Fees 07/21/16 File Notice Of Appeal - Citibank/Citibusiness Card 103.50
09/21/16 Filing Fees Record on Appeal Fee - Clerk, Broward County Circuit 121.80
Court
Postage thru 09/30/16 0.46
Westlaw Research thru 09/30/16 229.46
Total Expenses $639.22

Total This Matter $7,624.58



Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City October 27, 2016

Reference No. 184302 Page 17

Re: 023 Ethics Compliance Advice And Advisory Opinions

Date Services Hours Amount

09/07/16 ram Attend And Present Sunshine Law Materials To 1.20 276.64
Education Advisory Board - _

09/07/16 ram Finalize Preparation For EAB Training 0:30 69.16

09/19/16 ram Review And Analyze And Provide Guidance Related 0.50 116.27

_ } To Letter Of Recommendation On Private Stationery ,
09/27/16 ram Review And Analyze And Provide Guidance Related 1.00 230.54
B To Procurement Process »

09/28/16 ram ReviewAnd Analyze Ethics Issues Related To 0.50 115:27
Campaign ' »

Total for Services $806.88

Total This Matter $806.88

B —— 1



Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City
Reference No. 184302 '

Re: 024 Charter Review Board

Date Services

00/08/16 dmw  Examine Charter Amendment Election Materials
From City Clerk

Total for Services:

Total This Matter
Services
Expenses

Due This Bill

- October 27, 2016

Hours
0.20

Page 18

Amount
46.11

$46.11

T 4611

32,089.47

934.52

$33,023.99
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1573:.022
. o ‘Tnvolce No, Involce Date: ] Job No;
BAILEY 2 ASSOCIATES -
: Sl Sterhai : Radmiond Job Date Case No,
REPORTENG spe016 | cace 1-onzs02.(18)
‘Casemme
“WALTER JOLLIFF V5., COOPER CrTY
Matthew Mandel, Esquire’
‘Weiss, Sgro!a_r_le!ﬁ_nan Cole & Bierman Payment Terms
;:):E,;:Mard Bivd Oue upan recsipt:
“Fart Landerdale, Fi 33301
{CERTIFIED COPY OF mnsounv OF:
-Jarmes Cuman 43.00 Pages 1'50.50_
Index/Condensed 4300 Pages 21:50
Courler 12,00
TOTALDUE 355 $184,00

Unpald involces will accrue Interest after. 30 dayis at tie rate of 1,5%. Ordering party agrees to pay all-costs of collection incliiding
altomey’s fees. Paymerit not contingent on. cllent refmbuiserisht,

Tax 1D; 20-0429889

Matthew Mandel,.E5quire

Weiss Serata Heifiman Colé & Bisrman
200 E Broward Bivd

Ste 1900 ,

Fort Lauderdale, FL. 33301

RemitTo:  Balley & Astociites Reporting

500 €. Broward Blvd.
Sulte 1700 ‘
Fort Lauderdale, FI, 33394

Blease detacl hononr povtian ond rotinii ivith Payment,

Invoice No, 4647
lovoice Date. -+ 8/31/2016
TotalDue.  : $184.00

3ab o, 3 8556
By 1D i 1MAIN
Case No. + CACE13-012602 (18)

‘CaseNafie 1 ‘WALTER JOLLIFFVS: COOPER CITY



