COOPELR CITY

Someplace Special

MEMORANDUM

CITY MANAGER’S OFFICE

CITY OF COOPER CITY

P.O. BOX 290910

COOPER CITY, FL 33329-0910

T: 954-434-4300

F: 954-434-5099

E: coopercityhall@coopercityfl.org

TO: Mayor & Commissioners
FROM: Bruce D. Loucks, City Manager
DATE: July 15, 2014 /\/
RE: Monthly Report — June 2014
ADMINISTRATION:
1. Held all Staff hurricane preparatory meeting.
2. Attended Resource Recovery Board meeting to represent Cooper City.
3. Met with landiord and representatives regarding Flamingo Road Industrial Park to
discuss land use options.
4, Continued with Budget preparation activities.
5. Reviewed expired permit process to determine opportunities for expediting process.

BUILDING DEPARTMENT:

1.

VokwN

10.

Fees Collected
Impact Fees Collected
Permits Applied For
Permits Issued
Total Inspections Performed
a Structural
b Electrical
c. Plumbing
d Mechanical
e. Engineer/Utility
f. Fire
g Landscape
Local Business Tax Receipt
a. Inspections
b. Submittal

. Issued
d. fFees Collected
Certificate of Occupancy
a. Commercial
Certificate of Completion
Record Requests
Permits Closed (BS & A)
Permits Closed (Fortis)

C

260
148
84
49
35
14
0

4
14
17
$2,688.00

3

$ 60,065.44
$2,217.00
257
198
590

14
28
83
37
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11. Files Scanned into BSA 190 (5,408 pages)
Files Scanned into Fortis 37 (555 pages)

12. Update of Contractor Records 164

13. Lien Search 74

14. Customer Service Sign in Sheet 632

15. Permits Processed 183

16. Calls on permits for corrections 58

17. Mail Merge 18

18. Special Magistrate Cases 13

19. Notice of Hearing/Notice of Violation Letters 7

20. Scanning of wide format plans 0

21. Monthly reports for County, Property Appraiser, Growth Management, Census Bureau
and DPEP.

CITY CLERK'S OFFICE:

1. Prepared Agendas with backup material, attended 1 Commission meeting, 1
Commission workshop and 1 IT Oversight Meeting

2. Participated in a Hurricane Preparedness Meeting

3. Qualified 3 candidates for the November 4, 2014 Municipal Election

4, Met with staff relating to amending the LBTR and Special Event codes

5. Met with staff and Commissioner to review expired permit process

6. Clerk Services for Special Magistrate Hearing (37 cases), (2) Liens, and (1) Request for
Reduction of Fines

7. Processed 627 Passports

8. Processed 41 Garage Sale Permits, 1 Special Event Permit

9. Processed 29 Public Records Requests

10. Processed 33 Garbage Cart Requests/Complaints

11. Performed 46 Notary Services

12. Revised FRS rates in BS&A

13. Conducted 9 new hire orientations for summer staff

14. Created 9 personnel files for summer staff

15. Received training in applying postage for passport mail

16. Submitted Pollution/Liability Application to FMIT

17. Distributed COBRA bills

18. Distributed 6 employee evaluations

19. Recuperated $5,755 in property damage

20. Revised new job descriptions for Public Works

21. Posted job vacancies for Public Works

22, Updated driver list on Fleetwatch

23. Approved 1 FMLA request

24. Participated in 2 surveys

25. Promoted Weight Watchers to employees

26. Scheduled & promoted ICMA Loan Seminar to employees

27. Submitted invoice for payment of FMIT General Liability and Worker's Comp

28. Processed 3 garage sale permits

29. Reviewed code for special event permits

30. Answered 52 phone calls regarding passports

31. Active participation in all functions of LBTR, training/transitioning with Building

Department and coordinating with Fire Department, including report compilation, and
process assistance .
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32. Updated Inventory for Retail LBTR ~ 99 Business Tax Receipts

33. Created Receipt Accounts for Insurance Company Tax Receipts found by FLC

34, Performed Fortis Administration, archive/scan/index multiple documents into the Fortis
Archival System

35. Invoiced previously Recorded/Advertised Resolutions and/or agreements to be
reimbursed by petitioners.

36. Uploaded and Indexed Minutes from past board meetings on behalf of the board
administrators for the Education Advisory Board, Business Advisory Board, Green
Advisory Board, and Senior Citizen Advisory Board

37. Submitted/Confirmed/Posted (2) Advertisements of Legal Notices published with the
Sun-Sentinel Newspaper

38. Transcribed Minutes via recording for (2) Commission/Workshops

39. (1) Pre- Bid Meeting Attended (1) BID Opening

40. Performed notification and distribution tasks associated with all Commission Actions
and/or approvals, including notice and distribution to requesting departments and
interested parties for land development petitions, purchase requests, contract
renewals, task orders, etc.

411. Performed Copier Maintenance and Troubleshooting

42, Cash receipting for all City Clerk related accounts receivables and miscellaneous
receivables

43, Maintenance of supply inventory for the City Clerks’ Office, the Commission Office and
Administration

44, Processed for Recordation — Recorded and/or archived: (7} Special Magistrate
Liens/Releases of Liens

FINANCE DEPARTMENT:

1. Prepared Invitations to Bid and Requests for Proposals for several expiring contracts.

2. Participated in the effort of securing or maintaining abandoned foreclosed properties.

3. Coordinated preparation of fiscal year 2014-15 proposed budget

4, Attended City Commission workshop meeting

5. Repaired Domain Controller (server) and Exchange server (email)

6. Repaired multiple workstations infected with virus/malware that originated from a USB
flash drive

7. Attended hurricane preparedness meeting with City Manager

8. Completed State of Florida Annual Financial Report

9. Issued the following:

a. Accounts payable checks: 350

b. Payroll checks: 284

C. Meter reads and Utility bills issued: 11,726
d. Purchase orders: 22

e. Work orders: 196

10. Processed the following:

a. Customers at the Utility Billing window: 1,647
b. New utility accounts: 134
C. Lien searches: 102
d. Utility and passport payments: 9,021
11. Accounts Payable Invoices 534
12. Responded to I.T. service requests: 170
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GROWTH MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENT:

1

Land Development Items

a. Commission Meetings/Workshop ltems 2
b. Advisory Board Meeting ltems 0
C. DRC Meeting Items 2
Daily Activity

a Technical Assistance to Customers 95
b Zoning Permit/Plan Reviews 81
c. inspections 5
d Zoning Letters 0
e Alcohol License Review 2
f. Records Requests 2
g. Administrative Plan Revision Reviews 1
Miscellaneous Workload Indicators

a Local Business Tax Receipt Review 7
b Letter(s) of Flood Map Determination 2
c Elevation Certificates 0
d intergovernmental Coordination Meetings 2
e Developer/Applicant Meetings 4
Community Development Block Grant Program

a. No. of Billings

b. Inquiries per Month (Phone-Walk-in)

Special Misc. Projects

Planner attended Local Mitigation Strategy {LMS) Meeting at EOC
Director and Planner attended Hurricane Season Preparation Mtg.
Director attended Webinar on Planning and Ethics in Florida
Director and Planner attended Planning and Zoning Module training with BSA staff
Director and Planner conducted orientation with new P/Z Board member

Director and Planner met with Clerk's Office staff to review and update codes related
to Outdoor Sales and Special Events Permits

RER

m o o0

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT:

1.

Property Maintenance

a. Street lights repaired by City or Contractor 2

b. Number of Work Orders completed 37

c. Square footage of hard surface areas pressure cleaned 45,255
d. Foreclosed property maintenance 20

Parks Maintenance

Park acres mowed 198

Park trash removal / cleanup services 124
Athletic turf acres mowed 152

Athletic turf fertilized 29

Athletic turf acres herbicide application 38
Number of BB / SB field linings 68

Number of BB / SB infield dragging 243
Number of Hockey court cleanings 12
Number of Basketball court cleanings 12
Number of Irrigation system services 88
Roadway swale and median acres mowed 105
Number of miles of roadway debris cleanup 272

mET TSm0 a0 o
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m. Number of potholes repaired 7

n. Square footage of sidewalks replaced 10,904

0. Number of lifted sidewalk grinds performed 5

p. Number of root pruned trees 9

3. Landscape / Tree Maintenance

a. Number of trees pruned 264

b. Number of trees removed 2

c. Number of stumps ground 6

d. Number of tree removal permits issued 4

e. Number of landscape plants installed 36

f. Number of Plan Reviews performed / meetings 10

g Number of contractual work inspections performed 15

h. Number of Site Visits 67

i. Number of work orders completed 15

4, Fleet Services

a. Heavy Equipment 2

b. Vehicles 20

o Small Engines 15

d. Trailers 1

e. Permanent Generators — monthly maintenance 1

f. Utility Vehicles, golf carts, etc. 6

RECREATION DEPARTMENT:
1. Community Events:

a. On june 7th, the Pool & Tennis Center hosted 40 at the Summer Fun Pool Party.
Touch-A-Truck on June 14th was a huge success with residents exploring 30
trucks on display.

b. Dads swam free on Father's Day, June 15th at the Pool & Tennis Center.

2. Programming Activities:

a. Summer Youth Camps at the Community Center, Pool and Tennis Center, and
Teen Camp began June 9th.

b. Summer Tot Time Classes began on June 10th at the Community Center.

o Staff worked on preparations for the upcoming events: Summer Camp themes
and activities, Food Trucks Rolling into Cooper City, and Cooper City Challengers

3. Highlighted Adult programs and classes included: June 5th - Birthday/Anniversary

Luncheon, Pirate Fun Themed Adult Luncheon on June 13th, Lunch Bunch on June 20th

to Burger 21, Adult Trip to Dania Jai-Alai on June 24th, To Your Health monthly lecture

on June 11th, Movie Matinee Thursdays, Rummikub, Quilting Patch, Bunco and Pinnacle
groups met at the Community Center.

4. The Community Center and Pool and Tennis Center hosted several weekend rental
events in their respected Multi-Purpose Rooms.

5. Meetings:

The on-site meetings at the Community Center and Pool & Tennis Center included:

Recreation Advisory Board, Homeowners Association Groups, Senior Advisory Board,

Scout Troops and more.

6. Grant Update:

a. The Tree Inventory is progressing well with numerous volunteers participating in
the counting process.

b. The Historical Committee is progressing with plans for an upcoming July Open

House gathering.
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UTILITIES DEPARTMENT:

1. Produced 86.747 million gallons of potable water

2. Treated 78 million gallons of wastewater

3. Prepared Plant for Sanitary Survey

4, Replaced multiple surge arrestors due to lightning strike

5. Installed new bearing to blower no. 2

6. Conducted chemical cleaning of both degasifiers

7. Repaired five (5) meter leaks

8. Serviced six {6) 1” water service lines leaks

9. Replaced 108 water meters

10. Repaired one (1) sewer laterals from root intrusion

11. Conducted weekly stormwater erosion/sediment control inspections for two (2) construction
projects

12 Performed underground utility inspections for two (2) projects, water, sewer, drainage,
roadway, string lines/densities for two (2) projects

13. Performed one (1) drainage repair and one (1) flooding complaint

14. Engineering

a. Reviewed two {2) engineering plans, and issued two (2) permits.



Memo

To: Bruce D. Loucks, City Manager

From: David M. Wolpin, City Attorney’s Office

Date: July 11, 2014

Re: List of Pending Legal Work Matters as of July 11, 2014

1. CODE ENFORCEMENT
Handle applicable county court prosecutions for code violations and related activities.
Provide legal services for preparation and presentation of cases before city special
magistrate; and assist in facilitating the operation of successful special magistrate
program (Pablo Tamayo, Douglas Gonzales);

I LITIGATION
1) Defend City in fite assessment case. The Circuit Court granted plaintiff’s motion

IIL

to certify a class of plaintiffs. We had filed a Notice of Appeal of that preliminary
ruling to the Fourth District Court of Appeal, as authorized by the City Manager;
and have filed the City’s Briefs. Oral argument was held at the 4™ District on
November 5, 2013. By Per Curiam decision of November 14, 2013, the 4t
District ( without a written opinion) affirmed the Circuit Court’s certification of a
class of plaintiffs to allow the case to proceed as a class action. Since the appellate
court decision returned the case to the Trial Court, the previous stay or hold on
trial court proceedings is removed , and the defense of the case will proceed at
the Trial Court level pursuant to the several defenses asserted in the City’s
previously filed Answer and Affirmative Defenses. On June 2, 2014, the Trial
Court issued an Agreed Order requiring the Plaintiffs to publish and mail a notice
of the pending class action litigation , as required by the rules governing class
actions , so that persons who are alleged to be part of the class may know of the
class action and may decide whether to remain in or exclude themselves from the
class action as the case proceeds. No trial date has been set.  ( Ed Guedes, Matt
Mandel );

OTHER MATTERS




1)

2)

3)

4

5)

6)

7)

8)

9

10)

Handle labor issues and provide labor related advice for Human Resources
(Alison Smith, Brett Schneider);

Represent City as a party plaintiff in asset distribution litigation against Broward
County and in related dispute resolution and mediation proceedings, concerning
Resource Recovery Board / Solid Waste system , as authorized by City
Commission (Dan Abbott, Jamic Cole);

Advise on implementation of County ethics ordinances, and provide advisory

opinions when requested (David Wolpin, Robert Meyers);

As requested by City Manager, assist staff with collection of delinquent utility
bills including late fees (  Aleida Molina , David Wolpin);

Assist City management in review of Park Agreement amendment ; and follow-
up (Ignacio Del Valle);

Assist Growth Management department on matter of school as accessory use to
church ( Kathy Mehaffey );

Assist City administration in amendment/ update to Chapter 9 ( Business Taxes)
of City Code ( Alan Gabriel , David Wolpin);

Assist City administration in amendment to Chapter 12 of City Code concerning
dogs in Parks ( Alan Gabriel ; David Wolpin );

Assist City Manager on proposed ordinance amendment concerning driveway/
sidewalk maintenance ( Alan Gabriel); and

Examine City Commission Agenda Items for July 15, 2014, City Commission
Meeting.




WEISS SEROTA HELFMAN
PASTORIZA COLE & BONISKE, P.L.

2525 Ponce de Leon Boulevard
Suite 700

Coral Gables, Florida 33134
305-854-0800

Cooper City
9090 S.W. 50th Place
Cooper City, FL 33329

CLIENT: 1573 - Cooper City

Matter : Services Expenses Total
001 - General Representation 8,974.49 56.07 9,030.56
002 - Labor 1,755.38 0.00 1,755.38
003 - Ordinance Enforcement 1,194.06 0.00 1,194.06
003-1 - Speciat Magistrate Cases 2,150.38 0.00 2,150.38
004 - Planning and Zoning 307.17 0.00 307.17
005 - Public Works and Utilities 0.00 0.00 0.00
009 - Foreclosures v 43.88 0.00 43.88
022 - Joliff, Walter, Barbara - Class Action Challenge 43.88 0.00 43.88
to Fire Rescue Fees

023 - Ethics Compliance Advice And Advisory : 943.49 | 0.00 943.49
Opinions.

Due This Bill $15,468.80

—————
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Re: 001 General Representation

Date Services Hours Amount

06/02/14 pat Confer Re Real Tree Settlement; Correspondence 0.40 87.77
With Mr. Bradford Re Same

06/02/14 dmw  Examine And Follow-Up On Rescue Vehicle 0.20 43.88
Purchase ltem

06/03/14 dmw  Examine And Follow-Up On Rescue Vehicle 0.20 43.88
Purchase Item

06/04/14 pat Correspondence Re Real Tree Agreement; Confer 1.10 241.37

Re Same; Telephone Conference With Mr. Bradford;
Review And Revise Settlement

06/04/14 dmw  Examine And Follow- Up On Tree Trimming Matter 0.20 43.88

06/05/14 pat Telephone Conference And Correspondence With 0.70 153.60
Counsel For Real Tree; Follow-up Re Placement Of

» Settlement On Agenda

06/05/14 dmw  Examine And Follow- Up On Tree Trimming Bid 0.20 43.88
Award Matter '

06/05/14 dmw  Update Work Status Memo 0.20 43.88

06/06/14 pat Follow-up And Correspondence With Ms. Poling Re 0.40 87.77
Settlement Agreement; Confer Re Same

06/06/14 alg Conferences Re 11591 N. Open Court Past Due 0.40 87.77
Utility Account

06/06/14 alg Conferences Re 6/17 Agenda Matters 0.60 131.65

06/06/14 dmw  Examine And Reply To Correspondence On 0.20 43.88
Additional Exemption

06/06/14 dmw  Examine And Confer On Commission Agenda ltems 0.40 87.77

06/06/14 dmw  Confer On Utility Lien Matter 0.20 43.88

06/09/14 amm  Receive Review and Analyze Chan Bankruptcy For 0.80 175.54

Effect On Pending Code Enforcement Proceedings
And Pending Hearing; Correspondence Regarding
Same And Recommendations To Proceed With
Enforcement Proceedings

06/10/14 alg Review And Respond To Correspondence From Ms. 0.50 109.71
Hooks Re Application For Water 8830 SW 49th Place

06/11/14 pat Correspondence With Ms. Poling And Mr. Bradford 0.30 65.82
Re General Release

106/12/14 alg Review And Respond To Correspondence Re 0.80 175.54

Request To Rescind RFP Submittal

06/13/14 acs Analyze Issues Regarding Proposer's Attempt To 0.20 43.88
Rescind Proposal Following Proposal Opening

06/13/14 drg Brief Research Re Requested Use Of Law : 0.70 153.60

Enforcement Trust Funds; Prepare Correspondence
Summarizing Legal Requirements For Use Of Funds
And Analysis Of Requested Use (Purchase Of

. Scoreboard And Logo For Optimist Club)
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Date Services Hours Amount
06/13/14 alg Review And Respond To Correspondence From Ms. 0.50 109.71

Fisher Re Request To Rescind RFP Response;
Conferences Re Same

06/16/14 alg Review Commission Meeting Agenda And Materials 3.00 658.29

06/16/14 alg Review Correspondence Re 11591 N Open Court 0.40 87.77
- Past Due Account; Correspondence To Ms. Hooks
Re Same ‘

06/17/14 pat Prepare For And Attend City Commission Meeting Re  3.00 658.29
Arboricultural Bid

06/17/14 alg Preparation For Commission Meeting 2.00 438.86

06/17/14 alg Review BSO Services Agreement With City Re Use 0.80 175.54
Of Fire/Rescue Vehicle

06/17/14 alg Review And Respond To Correspondence From Mr. 0.40 87.77
Montes de Oca Re LETF Request; Conference Re
Same '

06/18/14 alg Review Workshop Agenda Backup Materials 0.50 108.71

06/18/14 alg Preparation For And Attend Workshop Meeting 3.00 658.29

- 06/19/14 pat Follow-up With Ms. Fisher Re Return Of Bid Bond 0.20 43.88

Tree Services Contract

06/20/14 dmw  Locate And Forward Cormrespondence On Additional 0.20 43.88
Exemption

06/20/14 dmw  Confer On Commission Meetings 0.20 43.88

06/20/14 dmw  Examine Correspondence On Utility Lien Matters 0.20 43.88

06/23/14 amm  Ingenito: Receive And Review Inquiry Regarding 1.90 416.92

Outstanding Lien Post-Foreclosure; Telephone
Conference With Mr. Feldman; Attention To Final
Judgment, Docket, Lien Of Cooper City;Draft
Emergency Motion For Release Of Funds To Cooper
City; Correspondence To Mr. Montes De Oca

Regarding Same

06/23/14 dmw Examine Correspondence On Utility Lien Matter, 0.30 65.82
Follow- Up

06/24/14 dmw  Examine Correspondence On Utility Lien Matter; . 0.20 43.88
Follow- Up '

06/25/14 alg Review Correspondence Re Proposed Amendment 0.50 109.71
To Parks Ordinance; Conferences Re Same

06/25/14 dmw  Confer On Dog- Park Ordinance 0.20 43.88

06/26/14 amm  Ingenito: Correspondence From/To New Owners - 020 43.88
Regarding Motion, Hearing

06/26/14 -amm  Ingenito: Follow Up Regarding Service Issues On 0.20 43.88
Motion For Surplus As To Lien On 11591 N Open
Court

06/26/14 amm  Ingenito Receive And Review Correspondence From  0.30 65.82

New Purchaser Regarding Additional Parties
Requesting Surplus, Attention To Same



Client Ref:

Date
06/26/14

06/26/14
06/27/14
06/27114

06/27/14
06/27/14

06/27/14
06/30/14
06/30/14

06/30/14

Total for Services

Date
06/06/14

Total Expenses

1573 - Cooper City
Reference No. 157019

alg
dmw
amm
drg

amm

alg

dmw
dmw

alg

amm

Services

Draft Proposed Ordinance Amending Animals And
Pets Regulations; Conferences Re Same; Review
City Parks And Recreation Regulations; Review And
Respond To Correspondence Re Proposed
Amendment '

Examine And Confer On Dog/ Park Ordinance
Ingenito Property Lien And Surplus: Receive
Additional Correspondence, Attention To Additional
Authority For Cooper City Position

Review And Analyze Possible Arguments Concerning
Foreclosure Of Priority Liens; Prepare
Carrespondence Re Same (Ingenito)

Attention To Standing Issues Regarding Ingenito
Property Surplus Funds ' ,
Review Park Regulations And Penalties; Conference
Re Same; Revise Proposed Amendment To Penalty
To Permit Magistrate Review; Conference Re Parks
And Recreation Concurrent Enforcement;
Correspondence Re Proposed Ordinance; Review
Cotrespondence From Mr. Bowman And Proposed
Additional Revisions;

Examine And Confer On Dog/ Park Ordinance;
Follow- Up

Examine And Confer On Dog/ Park Ordinance;
Follow- Up ,

Review Correspondence From Ms, Good Re
Proposed Animal Park Ordinance; Conference Re
Proposed Revisions; Preparation Of Proposed
Revised Ordinance; Correspondence To Client Re
Same .

Receive And Review Filings From Broward County,
Attention To Supplemental Certificates Of Service As
To Defendants; Correspondence From And To
Counsel For Purchaser; Draft Affidavit Of
indebtedness

For Disbursements Incurred

Description

Federal Express 04/21/14 Fed Ex To: Susan Poling, Cooper City Hall -

Federal Express Corporation
Postage thru 06/30/14
Westlaw Research thru 06/30/14

Hours
3.90

0.70

0.40

0.50

0.30
3.50

0.70
0.50
2.20

1.30

July 17, 2014
Page 3

Amount
855.78

153.60

87.77

109.71

65.82
768.00

153.60
109.71
482.75

285.26

$8,974.49

Amount
19.23

2.09
34.75

$56.07
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Total This Matter - $9,030.56
%
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Re: 002 Labor
Date Services Hours Amount
06/16/14 afs Telephone Conference With Ms. Zerof Concerning 0.40 87.77
' Public Records Request For Former City Police
Officer
06/16/14 afs  Prepare Correspondence To Ms. Poling Concerning 0.20 43.88
Personnel Files Requested By BSO Counsel
06/17/14 afs Review And Analyze Additional Public Records 0.40 87.77

Related To Officer Wengert Provided By Ms. Poling,
Intended For Release To Counsel For BSO Pursuant
- To Public Records Request
06/17/14 mrm Review And Redact Documents Concerning Mr. 0.70 153.60

Wengart Re Public Records Request ,

06/17/14 mrm  Conduct Research Re Confidentiality Of Documents  0.60 131.65
Relating To Drug Free Work Policy

06/17/14 mrm  Correspondence With Ms. Poling Re Public Records  0.20 43.88
Request Issue

06/17/14 mm  Receipt And Review Of Correspondence From Ms. 0.40 87.77
Poling Re Public Records Request Issue

06/17/14 mmm Conference Call With Ms. Poling Re Public Records 0.20 43.88
Request Issue

06/17/14 afs Review And Analyze Correspondence From Ms. 0.30 65.82

Zerof Concerning Authorizations By Officers Brown
And Wengert Related To Personnel Files
06/18/14 afs Review And Analyze Correspondence From Ms. 0.20 43.88
Poling Concerning Public Records Request By Ms.
Zerof; Prepare Responsive Correspondence To Ms.

Poling

06/18/14 mrmm  Review And Redact Personnel File Of Mr. Wengert 1.00 219.43
To Produce In Response To Public Records Request

06/18/14 mm Receipt And Review Of Executed Consent Forms Re  0.20 43.88
Issue Of Whether Or Not To Disclose Confidential
Information :

06/19/14 mrm  Conduct Research Re Public Records Conceming 0.80 175.54
Various Personnel File Documents

06/19/14 mrm Examine Matter Of Public Records Request Of 0.50 109.72
Personnel File

06/24/14 mmm Review And Redact Various Files For Mr. Brown For 1.50 329.14

_ Response To Public Records Request
06/25/14 mrm Follow Up Re Response To Public Records Request 0.40 87.77
Total for Services $1,755.38

Total This Matter $1,7556.38

b e



Client Ref:

1673 - Cooper City

Reference No. 157019

Re;

Date
06/09/14

06/12/14

06/20/14
06/23/14
06/25/14

06/25/14

06/26/14
06/26/14
06/30/14

Total for Services

003 Ordinance Enforcement

pat

pat

pat
pat
pat

lid

pat

acs

acs

Services Hours

Follow-up And Address Issues With Ms. Poling And 1.00
Ms. Freeston Re 5097 SW 89 Ave Status Of Liens

And Bankruptcy Re 11240 Rockinghorse; Confer Re

Same: Review Ms Poling’s Correspondence Re

Same

Telephone Conference With Mr. Slachter Re Lien 0.40
Status Of 5097 SW 89 Ave; Correspondence Re :

Same With Ms. Poling

Review And Respond To Correspondence From Mr. 0.50
Fowler Re Saratoga Dr Property: Follow-up Re Same
Follow-up Re Foreclosure Sale Re 10765 Saratoga 0.30
Dr Property And Confer Re Title Search

Review And Analyze Correspondence And Follow-up  0.70
With Ms. Poling And Ms Freeston; Correspondence

Re Title Search Re Delia Smith; Confer Re 10765

Saratoga Title Search

Receipt And Review Search Request Re Determine 1.00
Whether Foreclosure Sale Was Actually Consumated

And If So, Locate Certificate Of Title For New

Owners On Property Located At 10765 Saratoga Dr,

Cooper City, Broward County, Florida; Ran Public

Records And Case Search, Ran ATIDS Search On

Legal, Forwarded Certificate of Title Of Record Re

Embassy Lakes Master Owners Association, Inc.,

And All Findings And Search Results For Review;

Confer Re Same

Confer Re Status Of Preliminary Title Search Re 0.20
Delia Smith Property '

Review And Analyze Correspondences From Ms. 0.30
Wofford Regarding FPL Tree Removal Issue :
Finalize Research Concerning Landscape Buffer 1.70

Requirements And Statute Limiting Regulation In
Right-of-way For Electrical Transmission Or
Distribution Lines; Prepare Summary Regarding
FPL's Position Concerning Statute And City's
Authority

Total This Matter

July 17, 2014
Page 6

Amount
219.43

87.77

109.71
65.82
153.60

75.00

43.88
65.82
373.03

$1,194.06

$1,194.06

e .
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Re: 003-1 Special Magistrate Cases

Date Services Hours Amount
06/03/14 pat Review Subpoenas For June Hearing 0.20 43.88
06/06/14 pat Review Analyze And Respond To Correspondence 1.00 219.43

From Ms Freeston Re 11240 Rockinghorse Rd;
Review And Analyze Correspondence Re 5097 SW

97 Ave.
06/06/14 drg Review June 18 Special Magistrate Agenda 0.20 43.88
06/10/14 pat Review And Analyze Correspondence And Transfer 0.50 109.71

Of Deed Docs Re Ocasio Property - 4981 SW 95
Ave; Telephone Conference With Counsel For
Ocasio; Correspondence With Ms. Freeston Re

Same
06/16/14 pat Prepare For Special Magistrate Code Hearing 0.90 197 .48
06/17/14 pat Prepare For Special Magistrate Code Hearings 0.60 131.65
06/18/14 pat Prepare For Attend Special Magistrate Code 5.90 1,294.64

Hearings; Correspondence With Ms Freeston Re
Lien Status Re 12388 SW 52 St
06/19/14 pat Review And Respond To Correspondence With Ms 0.50 109.71
Freeston Re 5042 SW 89 Ave; Correspondence With
Ms. Thomas From Buyers Title ‘

Total for Services $2,150.38

Total This Matter $2,150.38
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Re: 004 Planning and Zoning

Date Services Hours Amount

06/24/14 dmw  Examine Church Cost Recovery Matter 0.20 43.88

06/26/14 dmw  Confer On Church School As Accessory Use ' 0.20 43.88

06/27/14 slt Review Facts Related to Request to Review Staff 0.20 43.88
interpretation Related to School at Church

06/27/14 dmw  Examine Church School As Accessory Use 0.20 43.88

06/27/14 kmm  Review Correspondence, Analyze Request, Analyze 0.60 131.65
Development And Use History Re School At Church

Total for Services $307.17

Total This Matter $307.17

e



Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City July 17, 2014
Reference No. 157019 : Page 9

Re: 005 Public Works and Utilities

Total This Matter $0.00

Lot



Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City
Reference No. 157019

Re: 009 Foreclosures

Date Services

06/23/14 drg Review Docket And Demolition Order; Reply To
Correspondence Re Notification Of Demolition
(10765 Saratoga Drive)

Total for Services

Total This Matter

July 17, 2014
Page 10

Hours Amount
0.20 43.88

$43.88

$43.88

e ]



Client Ref. 1573 - Cooper City July 17, 2014

Reference No. 157019 Page 11

Re: 022 Joliff, Walter, Barbara - Class Action Challenge to Fire Rescue Fees

Date Services Hours Amount

06/04/14 mhm  Review Order From Court Re Class Certification 0.20 43.88
Notice

Total for Services $43.88

Total This Matter $43.88




Client Ref: 1573 - Cooper City July 17, 2014

Reference No. 157019 Page 12

Re: 023 Ethics Compliance Advice And Advisory Opinions

Date Services Hours Amount

05/15/14 ram Review And Analyze And Prepare Response Related  0.70 153.60
To Any Potential Conflict From Foreclosure Case

06/18/14 ram Review And Analyze And Prepare Response Related  1.00 219,43
To Mayor's Quitside Employment Disclosure
Requirements

06/24/14 ram Research Filing Status Of Elected Officials Related 0.40 87.77
To July 1st Deadlines

06/24/14 ram Conference Concerning Mayor's Outside 0.30 65.82
Employment Disclosures

06/24/14 ram Review And Evaluate Forms Filed By Elected 0.30 65.82
Officials To Ensure Compliance With July 1st '

- Deadlines :
06/24/14 ram Prepare Correspondence To Mayor Concerning 0.30 65.82

Definition Of Remuneration Under The Broward
Ethics Ordinance
06/24/14 ram Examine City Website To Determine Posting Of 0.30 65.82
: Ethics-Related Forms Other Than Outside
Employment And Form 1

06/24/14 ram Examine City Website To Determine Whether All 0.30 65.82
Ethics Related Forms Have Been Posted
06/25/14 dmw  Confer On Disclosure Requirements 0.20 43.88

06/25/14 ram Review And Analyze And Prepare Response To 0.50 109.71
Correspondence From Mayor Related To Outside }
Employment Income

Total for Services $943.49

Total This Matter $943.49

b ]

Services 1541273

Expenses 56.7

Due This Bill
Past Due Balance
Amount Due $46:420-24



EXTERNAL MEMO

Date: July 7, 2014

To: Bruce Loucks, City Manager

From: Bruce Caruso, District Chi%

Subject: June 2014 Monthly Report

1) Alarm Activity
a) Total Responses , 222
b) Fire/Service Related Responses 72
c) Emergency Medical Responses 150
d) Mutual/Auto Aide Given 01
e) Mutual/Auto Aide Received 11

2) Fire Hydrant Maintenance/Flow Activity
a) Fire Hydrants Maintenance 170

3) Fire Marshal’s Office Activity

a) Plans Reviewed 12
b) New Const. Insp. 06
c) Annual Fire Insp. 137
d) Annual Re-Insp. 21
e) Fire Investigations 0

f) Fire Safety Educ. Presentations 04
4) Community Programs

a) C.P.R. Program 12
b) Car Seat Program 06

I:\Cooper City District\Cooper City Monthly & Annual Reports\June 2014 Cooper City Report.doc



Date Range: From 6/1/2014 To 6/30/2014
Station Selected: 28

111 - Building fire 1
113 - Cooking fire, confined o container 1
131 -Passengervehicle fire - 1
75271 . EMScaII éxéiuding vehicle éé&dent wifh Virnjury 137
322 -Vehicle accident with injuries 5
' 323 - Motor vehicle/pedestrian accident (MV Ped) o

324 -rl\/iotor vehicle accident with no injuriég N 7 é

381-Rescue or EMS standby 1

440 - VEVIVercr:tricalr wiring/equipm;’rtrbrrbblem,7 othér - 71

445 - Arcing,r 7srhorted electrical equment - 1#
511 - Lock-out - 2

520 - Water problem, othé; - 7 27

522 - Water or steam leak - 7 2
' 542 - Animal rescue o 3 7

550 - Public service assistancé, other 7 | 1

552 - Police matter 7 1
| 553 - Public service 7 " 8
554 - Assist invalid 4
”67117 TIsri;pétchred & céhﬁélied en route N 1 5

622 - No incident found on arrival at dispatch address Y
7 650 - Steam, other gés ;ﬁistakeﬁrfci)irﬁs?moke, other - 7”1 |
7"651 - Smoke scére, odor of smoﬂkrei 7 - - 3

653 - Barbecue: tar kettle N 7 - 1
671 - Hazrmarfwrrelease investigation w)iﬁérhaimrartr - 17
77715 - Lbcal él:E;fm system, malicious false alarm - 2
730 - Systerﬁiméifunction, other - 71

c:\firerms5sql\reports\S_incidents_cfai Station Incident Count Detail.rpt
Monday, July 7, 2014

Page 1 of 3



Date Range: From 6/1/2014 To 6/30/2014
Station Selected: 28

' 735 - Alarm system sounded due to malfunction

743 - Smoke detector activation, no fire - unintentional

} 740 - Unintentional transmission of alarm, other
.
|

744 - Detector activation, no fire - unintentional

. 745 - Alarm system sounded, no fire - unintentional

| E— — e

c:ffirerms5sqlireports\S_incidents_cfai Station Incident Count Detail.rpt Page 2 of 3
Monday, July 7, 2014



Hydrant Testing Activity Report Period: 6/1/2014 to 6/30/2014

District: 28

IDNUMBER Description Location Completion Date
CC1246 Flow / Maintain 5880 SW\\]02 AVE . 06/04/2014 o
jow/Mailitain’ /5820 SW e

o
CC12f19 \\ .

_— i 06/04/2014
l ‘\&M% & ‘O\‘%\\%&\

‘003346 ?Flow/Malntam 2803 Ponnmana CIR N el

iosagHT  Flow:Maintairi 1 /2819 Paincian: m&mx&m :

. &&\&WW@@\\\M :

1120 Grlfﬂn RD -

REDHAN ‘: e *s
4808 SW 119 TER I — R
OTER %\m\&m\\w e /04/2014

/ M‘&\RX&&\ ggi‘%%ﬁ%@éio4lzo;%\w\*§\\\§\%\*§

06/04/2014

Flow / Maintain 11903 53 PL sw N

037, R\K@%& &K\EXQE\%% I in i \ %\WMW -
OW aln A R SR w,\

06/04/2014 B
| &W
06/19/2014

c\fnrermsSsqI\reports\S hydrants activities Completed rpt
Monday, July 7, 2014 Page 3 of 8



Hydrant Testing Activity Report Period: 6/1/2014 to 6/30/2014

District: 28

IDNUMBER Description Location Completion Date
CC4040 Flow / I\{I\ain}ain 9 W‘\ B

M o

CC4194

S —
AR
S —

s

G et it
Flow / Maintain
L

X
D SRy

_CC4200

Sl A

o

DR X
4700

e R

SRR \\i\\\;‘%;\\ N \\\
012012014
p Ly

L R

%

06/1
T
A L
t Corner

-

-

'CC4250

e
N

w

7

S

B

Wl

U0 | \

R R S M \‘»
// N DA00 122 AVESW s
4269 s aintain 5400 SFlamingoRD 2014
Lociiol s el Rl
CC4271 \ Flow / Maintain 53 ~06/18/2014

G

D

) amingo RD

-

.

C4279 F

C

\\m&&\x\&\\\&\m&w\(}, 1 7/201
c:\firerms5sql\reports\S_hydrants_activities Completed.rpt

Monday, July 7, 2014 Page 4 of 8

,‘l >




Hydrant Testing Activity Report Period: 6/1/2014 to 6/30/2014

District: 28

IDNUMBER Description Location Completion Date
CC4287 Flow / Mamtaln 5451‘ S ‘Flamlngo RD OG{j 712014
Wl ; 5451 S FlamingcRD. JUIOE

\\m\\ L b

06/17/20 14
RO e

) ﬂ06/\1\ 7/2014

= f : N‘&%\g\%‘%@\@x .\‘*\l\x wRase
} ‘\,\10709 IndlaanRL

TE W&\\k&%&\%\\\% 6/20/2 m&x

13313 Lakepomte CIR
— \ y '.

. “‘“\T S

Sy

06/20/2014

. 0 e

( A v - 06/20/201‘4“\_,

! 4807 S Flammgo RD. S
Flow/ Mamtaln 4807 S FIammgo RD

o -

4. \M\ %\W N \X\\

: 06/20/214

CC4328 -
. e

c \flrermSSSqI\reports\S hydrants activities Completed rpt
Monday, July 7, 2014 Page 5 of 8



Hydrant Testing Activity Report Period: 6/1/2014 to 6/30/2014

District: 28

IDNUMBER Description Location Completion Date
CC4348 ;;\F|0w/ Mamtaln\ 06/1 3/2014

S

kaC"'350 S

;V\Q6/19/2o14 N
: 1%\\%\%&%
S ?\E%\\\\\i\\\

Sl _
) 4700 SFI mlngoRQ

SO
FIow/ Mamtaln
SN *\;\'h Sy \\ \x \ \‘\ ‘\\, -
W [ Maintal IR

District: 55A

IDNUMBER Description Location Completion Date
WS-55 0473 R \Flow‘/ Maintain __ 4018 Crossbil LANE‘ o 06/21/2014““

\WS‘55 0565 N .
t m “% w; m ﬁi*\ i ;
~ Flow/ Mamtaln 4509 Weston RD
‘ : i \ \ A s i

06/ 1 5/20\1 4 \\

«» X
\\06/15/2014 -

WS 55- 1729 Flow/ Malntaln Turnstone CT and Pond Rldge CIR 06/21/2014 :

c:\firerms5sqlireports\S_hydrants_activities Completed.rpt
Monday, July 7, 2014 Page 6 of 8
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INTERNAL MEMO

Date: July 2, 2014
To:  Bruce Loucks, City Manager
Cooper City

From: Captain Robert Cates
Cooper City District

Subject: June 2014 Report

During the month of June, Deputies assigned to the Cooper City District responded to 2703 calls for
service. Of these calls for service, a total of 36 are Part One (Persons and Property Crimes). The
remaining 2,667 calls are alarms, police service suspicious incidents, 911 hang ups, etc.

There were a total of 2 residential burglaries, 6 conveyance burglaries, and 4 auto thefts. There
were 37 arrests during the month in which some are documented below in the Items of Interest

section of this report.

A total of 119 code violations were addressed during the month of June. These violations are
initiated by Patrol Deputies, Parking Enforcement Personnel and Code Enforcement Inspectors.
Many of these cases and will require additional follow-up action.

Also included in this report is a breakdown of the 368 State Traffic Citations and 220 Traffic
Warnings issued by District Deputies. The Accident Report by Zone lists a total of 55 accidents
investigated by District Deputies during the month of June, there were no traffic fatality.



Items of Interest:

Items of Interest :

On 06.05.14 deputies responded to 5861 SW 99 Lane regarding a burglary to a residence in progress. The
caller (juvenile resident) told the 911 operator that she was upstairs and a black male had just shattered the
downstairs window and was gaining entry into the home. The juvenile was able to stay on the phone with
the 911 operator and provide updated details. During this event fearing for her safety the juvenile exited her
residence via the second floor bedroom window and jumped to the ground floor still providing updates.
Deputies were able to apprehend Kwamayne Davis as he was fleeing from the residence. There was a
second suspect who was driving a get-a-way vehicle who was able to flee before deputies arrived.
Investigation continues. The juvenile will be honored at the next Sheriff’s Office Award Ceremony.

On 06.17.14 Deputy Haber conducted a traffic stop on defendant Dan Delva for speeding. During the contact
with the defendant Deputy Haber could smell marijuana coming from the vehicle. After having the
defendant exit the vehicle, Deputy Haber observed marijuana all over the defendant’s clothes and the
drivers seat. Deputy Haber also located a firearm in the glove compartment. Defendant charged with
possession of marijuana and a weapons violation.

On 06.24.14 Deputy Haber conducted a traffic stop on defendant Raechel Joanne Ferrero regarding an
expired tag. During the encounter the defendant was extremely nervous and kept looking around. Upon
consent to search the vehicle, a trafficking amount of Oxycodone was discovered in the vehicle along with
$11,000 in cash. Major Narcotics detectives responded to the scene and interviewed the defendant.
Information was obtained from the defendant on her supplier.

On 06.28.14 Deputy Legra conducted a traffic stop on defendant Derek Adam Becker regarding an
equipment violation. During the encounter the defendant was acting very nervous which altered Deputy
Legra. Deputy Legra asked for consent to search the defendant. The defendant agreed but just prior to the
search admitted having needles and morphine in his possession. Defendant was charged with narcotics
violations.

On 06.28.14 Andrew Arndt was acting irrational at the Sunoco gas station located at 12200 Griffin Road. The
suspect started destroying display cases and throwing bottles of wine on the floor. Responding deputies met
with the suspect as he was sitting inside the car wash. The suspect refused orders to lay on the ground and
resisted the deputies. The suspect was hit with the Taser and baton and continued to violently fight with
deputies. Suspect charged with Resisting With Violence and Criminal Mischief
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Traffic Citations June 1 - June 30 2014
Cooper City District 16

7/1/2014

ATTACH TAG (LICENSE PLATE) NOT ASSIGNED

CARELESS DRIVING

CRASH LEAVE SCENE W/O GIVING INFORMATION (SPECIFY DAMAGE $$)

CRASH-FAIL TO LEAVE INFO UNATTENDED VEHICLE - PROP DAMAGE

DISOBEY/AVOID RED LIGHT

DISOBEY/AVOID RED LIGHT/TURNING

DISOBEY/AVOID TRAFFIC DEVICE

DL RESTRICTIONS/UNDER 17 AFTER CURFEW 11P-6A

DL SUSPENDED/ FINANCIAL RESPONSIBILITY



7/1/2014

DRIVE VEH UNSAFE/DEFECT EQUIP

DRIVE WHILE LIC SUSP 1ST OFF

DRIVE WHILE LIC SUSP 3RD OR SUBSQ OFF

DRIVE WHILE LIC SUSP HABITUAL OFFENDE

DRIVE WHILE LICENSE SUSP W/O KNOWLEDGE

DRIVE WHILE LICENSE SUSPENDED, REVOKED, CANCELLED W/KNOW

DRIVE WHILE LICENSE SUSPENDED/REVOKED/CANCELED/W/KNOWLEDGE

DRIVER PRESENT NON CURRENT INSURANCE

DRIVING W/ EXP LIC > 6MO

DUI ALCOHOL OR DRUGS 1ST OFFENSE

14

k]



71112014

DUl UBAL>.15 ORACCOM BY PERS < 18YOA

DUI-UNLAW BLD ALCH-.15 OR > OR ACCOM BY PERS < 18Y/0 1ST OFF

EXPIRED MTR VEH REGISTRATION OVER 6 MONTHS 1ST OFF

EXPIRED TAG LESS THAN 6 MOS

EXPIRED TAG/LESS THAN 6 MONTHS

FAIL CHANGE ADDRESS/NAME

FAIL DIM HEADLGHTS/IMP ADJUST

FAIL DRIVE IN SINGLE LANE

FAIL TO CHANGE ADDRESS ON DL

14



7/1/2014

FAIL TO DISPLAY VEH REG

FAIL TO NOTIFY HSMV CHG OF ADDRESS

FAIL TO REGISTER MOTOR VEH

FAIL WEAR SAFETY BELT/OPERATOR

FAILED TO YIELD - APPROACH/ENTER INTERSECTION

FAILED TO YIELD TO EMERGENCY VEHICLE

FAILURE TO OBEY DL RESTRICTIONS ORDERED BY COURT

FAILURE TO USE DUE CARE

FORGERY OF-ALTER VEH REGIS STICKER CERTIF OBSCURE PLATE

FTY/S AT SIDEWALK- ALLEY/BLDG/PRIV RD/DRIVE WAY TO VEH APPR

18

10



71/2014

FTYROW ENTER STATE HIGHWY

FTYROW WHEN TURNING LEFT

IMP STOP UN/LOAD PASG LIMT ACS

IMPROPER CHANGE OF LANE- PULL IN FRONT OF VEH SAME DIRECTION

IMPROPER LEFT TURN

IMPROPER RIGHT TURN

IMPROPER STOP/STAND/PARK

IMPROPER USE HOV LANE

LEARNERS DRIVERS LIC VIOL



7M/2014

LICENSE NOT CARRIED/EXHIBIT

LICENSE-REGISTRATION WEAPON-CARRY CONCEAL WEAPON FIREARM SPE

MUST HAVE PIP INS CARD

NO SAFETY BELTS- OPERATOR/PASSG UNDER 18

NO TAG LIGHT

OPER VEH UNSAFE/IMPROP EQUIP

OPERATE MOTOR VEHICLE WO VALID LICENS

OPERATE MOTORCYCLE WO LICENSE

OPERATING NON-CMV NOT PROPERLY INSURED PROOF OF INS REQUIRED

RAN STOP SIGN

21

24



7112014

RECKLESS DRIVING-DRIVES ANY VEH WILLFUL DISREGARD FOR SAFETY

RIDING BIKE WITH NO/IMP LIGHT

SIDE WIND/REST SUNSCREEN

SLOW SPEED/IMPEDE TRAFFIC

TAG UNSECURED/OBSCURED/IMPROPER DISPLAY/DEFACED/NONE

TEMPORARY TAG - EXPIRED 7 DAYS OR LESS

TEXTING WHILE DRIVING

TOO FAST FOR CONDITIONS

TRAFFIC OFFENSE-DUI ALCOHOL OR DRUGS 3RD VIOL W/IN 10 YEARS



712014

TURNED WHEN UNSAFE/NO SIGNAL

TWO LGTD HEADLAMP/REQ/M/V

UNL/SPEED IN SCHOOL ZONE

UNLAWFUL SPEED POSTED MUNICIP/COUNTYRD

UNLAWFUL SPEED POSTED STATE/INTERSCT

VEH W/O LIGHTS NIGHT

Total Citations = 368

52

59
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BROWARD COUNTY SHERIFFS OFFICE

By Zone

Zone1601

BRGC 2
BURG 2

Zone1602

BRGB 1
BRGC 1
BURG 2
THFB 1
THFD 1
THFO 1

Zone1603

BRGC 2
BURG 1
SEXB 1
THFB 1
THFO 3
THFR 2

Zone1604

AUTT 1
BRGC 7
BURG 1
SEXB 1
THFO 5

Zone1605

BRGC 2
BURG 2
THFB 1

Zone1606

AGGA 1
BRGC 4

Zone1607

BRGC §
BURG 1

6/1/2013 - 6/30/2013

BURGLARY CONVEYANCE
BURGLARY RESIDENCE

Total: 4

BURGLARY BUSINESS
BURGLARY CONVEYANCE
BURGLARY RESIDENCE
THEFT - BICYCLE

THEFT FROM BUILDING
THEFT - ALL OTHER

Total: 7

BURGLARY CONVEYANCE
BURGLARY RESIDENCE
SEXUAL BATTERY

THEFT - BICYCLE

THEFT - ALL OTHER

THEFT - RETAIL / SHOPLIFTIN!

Total: 10

AUTO THEFT - TRUCK/BUS
BURGLARY CONVEYANCE
BURGLARY RESIDENCE
SEXUAL BATTERY

THEFT - ALL OTHER

Total: 15

BURGLARY CONVEYANCE
BURGLARY RESIDENCE
THEFT - BICYCLE

Total: 5

AGGRAVATED ASSAULT
BURGLARY CONVEYANCE

Total: 5

BURGLARY CONVEYANCE
BURGLARY RESIDENCE

By Zone

Zone1601

AUTO 1
BURG 1
LEWD 1
ROBB 1

Zone1602

AUTO 1
BURG 1
ROBB 1
THFB 1
THFO 1

Zone1603
THFO 4

Zone1604

AUTO 2
BRGC 2
THFO 3
THFR 5

Zone1605
THFO 2

Zone1606
THFO 1

Zone1607

BRGC 3
THFB 1
THFO 2

Zone1608
BRGC 1

6/1/2014 - 6/30/2014

AUTO THEFT

BURGLARY RESIDENCE

LEWD / LASCIVIOUS MOLESTATION
ROBBERY

Total: 4
AUTO THEFT
BURGLARY RESIDENCE
ROBBERY
THEFT - BICYCLE
THEFT - ALL OTHER

Total: 5

THEFT - ALL OTHER
Total: 4
AUTO THEFT
BURGLARY CONVEYANCE
THEFT - ALL OTHER
THEFT - RETAIL/ SHOPLIFTING

Total: 12

THEFT - ALL OTHER

Total: 2

THEFT - ALL OTHER

Total: 1

BURGLARY CONVEYANCE

THEFT - BICYCLE
THEFT - ALL OTHER

Total: 6

BURGLARY CONVEYANCE
Total: 1
Grand: 35




BROWARD COUNTY SHERIFFS OFFICE

THFO 2 THEFT - ALL OTHER

Total: 8

Zone1608

THFD 1 THEFT FROM BUILDING

Total: 1

Grand: 55




BROWARD COUNTY SHERIFFS OFFICE

6/1/12013 - 6/30/2013 6/1/12014 - 6/30/2014

By Zone

16

14

12
10

# Incidents

8
6
4
2
0

1601 1602 1603 1604 1605 1606 1607 1608

& 2013 & 2014

Zone1601 4 4 00 %
Zone1602 7 5 286 %
Zone1603 10 4 -60.0 %
Zone1604 15 12 -20.0 %
Zone1605 5 2 -60.0 %
Zone1606 5 1 -80.0 %
Zone1607 8 6 250 %
Zone1608 1 1 00 %

Total: 55 35 -36.36 %




BROWARD COUNTY SHERIFFS OFFICE

By District
AGGA 1
AUTT 1
BRGB 1
BRGC 23
BURG 9
SEXB 2
THFB 3
THFD 2
THFO 11
THFR 2

Total:

Grand:

6/1/2013 - 6/30/2013

AGGRAVATED ASSAULT

AUTO THEFT - TRUCK/ BUS
BURGLARY BUSINESS
BURGLARY CONVEYANCE
BURGLARY RESIDENCE
SEXUAL BATTERY

THEFT - BICYCLE

THEFT FROM BUILDING
THEFT -ALL OTHER

THEFT - RETAIL / SHOPLIFTING

55
55

By District

AUTO
BRGC
BURG
LEWD
ROBB
THFB

THFO
THFR

NN =N A

Total:
Grand:

6/1/2014 - 6/30/2014

AUTO THEFT

BURGLARY CONVEYANCE
BURGLARY RESIDENCE

LEWD / LASCIVIOUS MOLESTATION
ROBBERY

THEFT - BICYCLE

THEFT - ALL OTHER

THEFT - RETAIL / SHOPLIFTING

35
35




BROWARD COUNTY SHERIFFS OFFICE

24

20

16

12

# Incidents

AGGA
AUTO
AUTT
BRGB
BRGC
BURG
LEWD
ROBB
SEXB
THFB
THFD
THFO
THFR

6/1/2013 - 6/30/2013 By Tyge 6/1/2014 -6/30/2014

e dRit <o S i L |

AGGA AUTO AUTT BRGB BRGC BURG LEWD ROBB SEXB THFB THFD THFO THFR

B 2013 7 2014

AGGRAVATED ASSAULT 1 0 -100.0 %
AUTO THEFT 0 4 4000 %
AUTO THEFT - TRUCK / BUS 1 0 -100.0 %
BURGLARY BUSINESS 1 0 -100.0 %
BURGLARY CONVEYANCE 23 6 <739 %
BURGLARY RESIDENCE 9 2 -77.8 %
LEWD / LASCIVIOUS MOLESTATION 0 1 100.0 %
ROBBERY 0 2 2000 %
SEXUAL BATTERY 2 0 -100.0 %
THEFT - BICYCLE 3 2 -33.3 %
THEFT FROM BUILDING 2 0 -100.0 %
THEFT -ALL OTHER 1 13 18.2 %
THEFT - RETAIL/ SHOPLIFTING 2 5 150.0 %
Total: 55 35 -36.36 %




BROWARD COUNTY SHERIFF S OFFICE

By Date

6/1/2013

6/3/2013

6/4/2013

6/5/2013

6/8/2013

6/9/2013

6/10/2013
6/11/2013
6/14/2013
6/156/2013
6/16/2013
6/17/2013
6/18/2013
6/19/2013
6/20/2013
6/22/2013
6/24/2013
6/25/2013
6/26/2013
6/27/2013
6/28/2013
6/29/2013

Total:

WNWeEa=2N=2 NN = NWN=2NO A AR

55

By Date

6/3/2014
6/4/12014
6/5/2014
6/6/2014
6/7/2014
6/8/2014
6/9/2014
6/11/2014
6/13/2014
6/14/2014
6/15/2014
6/16/2014
6/17/2014
6/18/2014
6/19/2014
6/20/2014
6/22/2014
6/24/2014
6/25/2014
6/27/2014
6/28/2014

NN = = DN @ N = ke cd AN N =N

(2]
o

-36.36%

Part 1 Offenses
June 2013 - 2014
Comparison
Cooper City
District 16
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Traffic Warnings June 1 - June 30, 2014
Cooper City District 16

71112014

ATTACH TAG (LICENSE PLATE) NOT ASSIGNED 1
DISOBEY/AVOID RED LIGHT 4
DISOBEY/AVOID TRAFFIC DEVICE 6
DISOBEYED STOP/YIELD SIGN 3
DRIVE VEH UNSAFE/DEFECT EQUIP 3
DRIVE WHILE LICENSE SUSPENDED/REVOKED/CANCELED/W/KNOWLEDGE 1
EXPIRED MTR VEH REGISTRATION OVER 6 MONTHS 1ST OFF 3
EXPIRED TAG LESS THAN 6 MOS 12
FAIL TO CHANGE ADDRESS ON DL 2
FAIL TO DISPLAY VEH REG 9

FAIL TO OBEY SIGN/SIGNAL 1



7M1/2014

FAIL WEAR SAFETY BELT/OPERATOR

FAILURE TO MOVE OVER FOR EMERGENCY VEHICLE

FAILURE TO MOVE OVER/SL.OW DOWN FOR EMG VEH

FAILURE TO OBEY RESTRICTIONS PLACED ON DL

FLORIDA SEAT BELT LAW VIOLATION

FNT ST PASS/OVR 18/SEAT-BELT VIOLATION

HEAD LAMP VIOLATION

HEADLIGHTS REQUIRED / TINTED

IMPROPER STOP/STAND/PARK

LICENSE NOT CARRIED/EXHIBIT

MUST HAVE PIP INS CARD



71112014

NO TAG LIGHT

OPER VEH UNSAFE/IMPROP EQUIP

OPERATING NON-CMV NOT PROPERLY INSURED PROOF OF INS REQUIRED

RAN STOP SIGN

RIDING BIKE WITH NO/IMP LIGHT

SIDE WIND/REST SUNSCREEN

TAG UNSECURED/OBSCURED/IMPROPER DISPLAY/DEFACED/NONE

TAIL LIGHTS NONE/IMPROPER

TEMPORARY TAG - EXPIRED 7 DAYS OR LESS

TEXTING WHILE DRIVING SECONDARY OFFENSE

UNL/SPEED IN SCHOOL ZONE

UNLAWFUL SPEED POSTED MUNICIP/COUNTYRD

19

10

56



7M1/2014

UNLAWFUL SPEED POSTED STATE/INTERSCT

U-TURN: IMPROPER/UNSAFE/PROHIBITED

Total Citations = 220

32



